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Summary of Conservation Objectives and Advice on Activities  
 
The Conservation Objectives and Advice on Activities are set out for the Southern North Sea 
possible SAC (pSAC) for the Annex II species harbour porpoise (Phocoena phocoena). The 
site covers both inshore (within 12 nautical miles of coast) and offshore (beyond 12 nautical 
miles of coast) waters where Natural England (NE) and the Joint Nature Conservation 
Committee (JNCC) have respective advisory responsibilities.  


The general objective of achieving or maintaining Favourable Conservation Status (FCS) for 
all species and habitat types listed in Annexes I and II of the Habitats Directive needs to be 
translated into site-level Conservation Objectives. These describe the condition to be 
achieved by species and habitat types within the sites in order for the site to contribute in the 
best possible way to achieving FCS at the national, bio-geographical and European level. 
The Conservation Objectives have been developed for the feature (harbour porpoise) 
throughout the recommended possible SAC network to ensure coherence across the 
network. This is also appropriate for a wide ranging, mobile and continuous population. The 
Advice on Activities is site-specific but based on a broad assessment of the sensitivity of the 
harbour porpoise to man-made pressures at a UK scale. The advice has been developed 
using the best-available scientific information and expert interpretation as at November2015. 
The advice provided here will be subject to change as our knowledge about the site and the 
impacts of human activities improve.  


The site should be managed in a way that ensures that its contribution to the maintenance of 
the harbour porpoise population at FCS is optimised. This may require management of 
human activities occurring in or around the site if they are likely to have an adverse impact 
on the site’s Conservation Objectives either directly or indirectly identified through the 
assessment process. Management of activities that may affect processes on which the 
harbour porpoise is dependent, e.g. recruitment of prey species from supporting habitats, 
cannot be considered at present due to insufficient (often no) evidence linking habitat 
characteristics to prey of the harbour porpoise. There is some information on the prey of 
harbour porpoises, but their prey preferences whilst within the sites are not well known. It 
should be noted that as European Protected Species under Annex IV of the Habitats 
Directive, harbour porpoise are already strictly protected wherever they are in European 
waters. As such several management measures are already in place in the UK. 


To fulfil the Conservation Objectives for the Southern North Sea harbour porpoise site, the 
relevant1 and competent2 authorities should consider human activities within their remit 
which might affect the integrity of the site.  


                                                
1
 Relevant authorities are those who are already involved in some form of relevant marine regulatory 


function and would therefore be directly involved in the management of a marine site. 
2
 A competent authority is any Minister, government department, public or statutory undertaker, public 


body of any description or person holding a public office. 
 







 
 


 
 


Contents 
1 Introduction .................................................................................................................... 1 


1.1 Background............................................................................................................. 1 


2 Responsibilities of Relevant and Competent Authorities ................................................ 2 


3 Conservation Objectives for harbour porpoise SACs ..................................................... 2 


3.1 The role of Conservation Objectives ....................................................................... 2 


3.2 Background to Conservation Objectives ................................................................. 3 


3.3 The Southern North Sea pSAC Conservation Objectives ........................................ 3 


4 Advice on Activities ........................................................................................................ 7 


4.1 Purpose of advice ................................................................................................... 7 


4.2 Background............................................................................................................. 8 


5 Activity assessments at UK scale ................................................................................... 8 


6 Site specific considerations: Southern North Sea pSAC ............................................... 10 


6.1 Sensitivity of harbour porpoise to existing activities within or impacting on the site 10 


6.2 Limitations of the evidence .................................................................................... 15 


7 References .................................................................................................................. 16 


8 Annex A: Assessment process to establish the significant threats to UK harbour 
porpoise populations ........................................................................................................... 18 


9 Annex B: Definitions of Pressures as applied within harbour porpoise SAC Advice on 
Activities.............................................................................................................................. 24 


 


 
 







1 
 


1 Introduction  


1.1 Background 


A potential network of eight sites was identified within UK waters for harbour porpoise 
(Phocoena phocoena). Sites were identified within the UK portions of Management Units 
(MUs) defined for the species (ICES, 2014; IAMMWG, 2015a). The Welsh and Northern 
Ireland Governments, along with Defra on behalf of England and offshore waters, gave 
approval for sites within their areas of jurisdiction to proceed to consultation. The resulting 
five sites are shown in Figure 1. 


 


Figure 1: Possible Special Areas of Conservation for the harbour porpoise, Phocoena phocoena 
identified in Northern Ireland, England, Wales and offshore waters. The MU boundary refers to 
management units North Sea and Celtic and Irish Seas.  
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This advice is for the Southern North Sea site (Figure 2) which is subject to protection under 
the Habitats Directive as transposed by the Conservation of Habitats and Species 
Regulations 20103 and the Offshore Marine Conservation Regulations (Natural Habitats, 
etc.) Regulations 20074 (as amended). The advice is given in fulfilment of the duty of the 
Statutory Nature Conservation Bodies (SNCBs) under the Habitats Regulations to inform 
Relevant and Competent Authorities as to (a) the Conservation Objectives for the site; and 
(b) any activities which may negatively impact the feature [harbour porpoise] for which the 
site is designated. The SNCBs aim to ensure that the Conservation Objectives are up-to-
date, accessible and allow the assessment of the impact of proposed developments against 
them.  


 


2 Responsibilities of Relevant and Competent Authorities 
The Habitats Regulations require Relevant and Competent Authorities to exercise their 
functions so as to secure compliance with the Habitats Directive. Competent Authorities 
must, within their areas of jurisdiction, have regard to both direct and indirect effects on the 
site. This may include consideration of issues outside the boundary of the SAC, if the impact 
of these occurs within the site boundaries. Relevant and Competent Authorities are not 
required to undertake any actions or ameliorate changes in the condition of the site if it is 
shown that the changes result wholly from natural causes.  


The natural variability of harbour porpoise distribution and abundance within sites is likely to 
be large due to the mobility and wide ranging nature of this species. Apparent deterioration 
of harbour porpoise presence at the site must be contextualised in terms of the natural 
variability in abundance and distribution patterns at the population level (i.e. Management 
Unit level). SNCBs will work with Relevant and Competent Authorities and others to agree a 
protocol to guide assessments, and this will require consideration for the population at the 
wider scale MU population.  It is essential that any assessment for the site reflect the natural 
variation of the species, including assessments in the condition of the site.  


 


3  Conservation Objectives for harbour porpoise SACs 


3.1 The role of Conservation Objectives  


Site level Conservation Objectives are a set of specified objectives that must be met to 
ensure that the site contributes to maintaining or achieving Favourable Conservation Status 
(FCS) of the designated site feature(s) at the national and biogeographic level (EC, 2012). 
Conservation Objectives constitute a necessary reference for identifying site-based 
conservation measures and for carrying out Habitat Regulations Assessments of the 
implications of plans or projects. The purpose of the Habitat Regulations Assessment is to 
determine whether a plan or project adversely affects a site’s integrity. The critical 
consideration in relation to site integrity is not the extent or degree of an impact, or whether 
an impact is direct or indirect, but whether the implications of any activities affecting a site, 
either individually or in combination with other plans or projects, affect the site’s ability to 
achieve its conservation objectives and favourable conservation status. 


Harbour porpoise are protected everywhere in European waters under the provisions of 
Annex IV and Article 12 of the Habitats Directive. The harbour porpoise in UK waters is 
considered part of a wider European population and the mobile nature of this species means 
that the concept of a ‘site population’ may not be appropriate for this species. Site based 


                                                
3
 http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2010/490/pdfs/uksi_20100490_en.pdf 


4
 http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2007/1842/pdfs/uksi_20071842_en.pdf 


 



http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2010/490/pdfs/uksi_20100490_en.pdf

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2007/1842/pdfs/uksi_20071842_en.pdf
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conservation measures will complement wider ranging measures that are in place for the 
harbour porpoise.  


 


3.2 Background to Conservation Objectives  


The Conservation Objectives are designed to ensure that the obligations of the Habitats 
Directive can be met. Article 6(2) of the Directive requires that there should be no 
deterioration or significant disturbance of the qualifying species or to the habitats upon which 
they rely. Therefore, the focus of the Conservation Objectives for harbour porpoise sites is 
on addressing pressures that affect site integrity and would include: 


 killing or injuring significant numbers of harbour porpoise (directly or indirectly); 


 preventing their use of significant parts of the site (disturbance / displacement); 


 significantly damaging relevant habitats;  or 


 significantly reducing the prey base. 
 


This Conservation Objectives document includes both a statement of the actual 
Conservation Objectives and supplementary advice with regard their intent and interpretation 
specific to the site. The Objectives have been set taking account of European Commission 
guidance (EC, 2012).  Further guidance on their specific application to certain casework will 
also be provided at a later stage. 


 


3.3  The Southern North Sea pSAC Conservation Objectives 


The Southern North Sea pSAC is the largest of the possible SACs proposed for the 
conservation of harbour porpoise (Figure 2).  The qualifying feature of the site is the Habitats 
Directive Annex II species:  


 harbour porpoise (Phocoena phocoena) 


Seasonal differences in the relative use of the site have been identified based on the 
analyses of Heinänen and Skov (2015) which shows that harbour porpoise occur in elevated 
densities in some parts of the site compared to others during summer and winter (Figure 
2).The seasonality in porpoise distribution should be considered in the assessment of 
impacts and proposed management.  
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Figure 2: The Southern North Sea possible Special Area of Conservation for harbour porpoise 


showing summer and winter areas.  
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The Conservation Objectives for the site are: 


  


To avoid deterioration of the habitats of the harbour porpoise or significant 
disturbance to the harbour porpoise, thus ensuring that the integrity of the site is 
maintained and the site makes an appropriate contribution to maintaining Favourable 
Conservation Status (FCS) for the UK harbour porpoise.  


To ensure for harbour porpoise that, subject to natural change, the following attributes are 
maintained or restored in the long term:  


1. The species is a viable component of the site. 


2. There is no significant disturbance of the species. 


3. The supporting habitats and processes relevant to harbour porpoises and their prey are 
maintained. 


 


These Conservation Objectives are common across all sites proposed for this species to 
ensure coherence across the network (EC, 2012). These Conservation Objectives are based 
on considerations of the ecological requirements of the species within the site, yet their 
interpretation is contextualised in their contribution to maintaining FCS at a wider scale (EC, 
2012). With regard the Southern North Sea site, harbour porpoise need to be maintained 
rather than restored. Maintain implies that, based on our existing understanding, the feature 
is regarded as being in favourable condition and will, subject to natural change, remain in 
this condition after designation.  


 


1. The species is a viable component of the site:  


Harbour porpoises are considered to be a ‘viable component’ of the site if they are able to 
survive and live successfully within it. The Southern North Sea site has been selected 
primarily on the basis of its long-term, preferential use by harbour porpoise in contrast to 
other areas of the North Sea. The implication is that this site provides good foraging habitat 
and it may also be used for breeding and calving. However, because the number of harbour 
porpoise using the site naturally varies, there is not an exact number of animals within the 
site above which the species is viable or below which it will become unviable.  


For that reason, the intent of this objective is to minimise the risk posed by activities within 
the site to the species viability. Activities that kill, injure or significantly disturb harbour 
porpoise have the potential to affect species viability within the site.  


The harbour porpoise is a European Protected Species (EPS) listed on Annex IV of the 
Habitats Directive and as such is protected under Article 12 from deliberate killing (or injury), 
capture and disturbance throughout its range. However, the relevant/competent authorities 
are reminded of these provisions and their application to the site as an integral part of the 
species’ range. The Habitats Directive Article 12 guidance5 proposes the following definition 


of deliberate: “deliberate actions are to be understood as actions by a person who knows, in 


the light of the relevant legislation that applies to the species involved, and the general 
information delivered to the public, that his action will most likely lead to an offence against a 
species, but intends this offence or, if not, consciously accepts the foreseeable results of his 
action”.  


The meaning of ‘deliberately injure’ should be taken from the definition under regulations 
41(1)(a) and 39(1)(a) of the Conservation (Natural Habitats etc.) Regulations 1994 and its 


                                                
5
 http://ec.europa.eu/environment/nature/conservation/species/guidance/pdf/guidance_en.pdf 



http://ec.europa.eu/environment/nature/conservation/species/guidance/pdf/guidance_en.pdf
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amendments consolidated in The Conservation of Habitats and Species Regulations 2010 
for England and Wales 


The disturbance under Article 12(1)(b) must be deliberate and not accidental. The definition 
of ‘deliberate disturbance’ is given in 39(1)(b) of Offshore Marine Conservation (Natural 
Habitats, etc.) Regulations 2007 (Offshore Marine Regulations, OMR, as amended in 2009 
and 2010). It is an offence under these Regulations to deliberately disturb EPS in such a 
way as to: a) impair their ability to survive, to breed or reproduce, or to rear or nurture their 
young or b) to affect significantly the local distribution or abundance of that species. Further 
guidance as to the interpretation of and what constitutes ‘deliberate’ and ‘significant 
disturbance’ is given in the JNCC EPS guidance6. These definitions of types of disturbance 
are for the purposes of assessing the need for an EPS licence and apply throughout UK 
waters. 


Bycatch of harbour porpoise in fishing nets is not deliberate but incidental killing. Article 12 
(4) of the Habitats Directive applies and states that Member States ‘shall establish a system 
to monitor the incidental capture and killing of the species listed on Annex IV (all cetaceans). 
In the light of the information gathered, Member States shall take further research or 
conservation measures as required to ensure that incidental capture and killing does not 
have a significant negative impact on the species concerned’. Consideration must be given 
to the effect of bycatch on the conservation status of harbour porpoise at the population 
level. The impacts of bycatch within a site contribute to impacts from bycatch outside the site 
and thus may affect the conservation status of harbour porpoise. Bycatch, therefore, poses a 
risk to the viability of the population and therefore could be deemed to affect the integrity of 
the site. Measures may be needed to minimise the risk of bycatch to porpoises using the 
site.  


 


2. There is no significant disturbance of the species within the site  


Disturbance of harbour porpoise generally, but not exclusively, originates from activities that 
cause underwater noise (section 4). Responses to noise can be physiological and/or 
behavioural. JNCC has produced guidelines to minimise the risk of physical injury to 
cetaceans from various sources of loud, underwater noise7. However, disturbance is a 
behavioural (non-injurious) response to noise and may lead to harbour porpoises being 
displaced from the area affected.  


Within sites, the immediate effects of disturbance are in the loss (usually temporary) of 
habitat available to harbour porpoise.  The Southern North Sea site has been identified on 
the basis of having persistent higher densities of harbour porpoises (Heinänen and Skov 
2015) when compared to other areas of the UK’s North Sea continental shelf which is linked 
to the habitats within the site that likely promote good feeding opportunities. Therefore, 
activities within the site should be managed to ensure access to the site; any disturbance 
should not lead to the exclusion of harbour porpoise from a significant portion of the site for a 
significant period of time. Case Work Advice Guidance in relation to various activities is 
being developed and expands this supplementary advice to define ‘significant portion and 
period’ in the context of impacting site integrity.   


This Conservation Objective aims to ensure that the site contributes, as best it can, to 
maintaining the Favourable Conservation Status of the wider harbour porpoise population. 
As such, how the impacts within the site translate into effects on the North Sea Management 
Unit population are of greatest concern.   


 


 


                                                
6
 http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/PDF/consultation_epsGuidanceDisturbance_all.pdf 


7
 http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-4273 



http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/PDF/consultation_epsGuidanceDisturbance_all.pdf

http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-4273
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3. The supporting habitats and processes relevant to harbour porpoises and their 
prey are maintained.  


The harbour porpoise is a species that is highly dependent on a year-round proximity to food 
sources and its distribution and condition may strongly reflect the availability and energy 
density of its prey (Brodie 1995 in Santos & Pierce, 2003). The densities of porpoise using 
the site are likely linked to the availability (and density) of prey within this site. Porpoise eat a 
variety of prey including gobies, sandeel, whiting, herring and sprat (which all have spawning 
grounds within the Southern North Sea site). However, the diet of porpoises specifically 
when using the site is unknown. The activity which potentially risks the achievement of this 
CO is commercial fishing; although environmental variability also plays a role in determining 
the status of fish stocks. However, currently there is no evidence to suggest that competition 
for prey species with commercial fisheries is having an impact on the conservation status of 
the harbour porpoise.  


The delineation of the Southern North Sea site is based on the prediction of ‘harbour 
porpoise habitat’ within the North Sea (Heinänen and Skov 2015). Habitat, in this context, 
means the characteristics of the seabed and water column. Peaks in density of harbour 
porpoise in the Southern North Sea site vary seasonally (Figure 2). At the Management Unit 
scale, for both the summer and winter seasons the distribution of harbour porpoise is related 
to water depth and variables within the water column (Heinänen & Skov 2015). Harbour 
porpoise density peaked in stable stratified waters (based on vertical differences in 
temperature) with lower gradients of eddy activity (turbulence); higher densities were also 
found in areas with current speeds of 0.4-0.6m/s. The analysis indicated a preference for 
water depths between 30 and 50m throughout the year. In general, in both seasons, harbour 
porpoise preferred coarser seabed sediments (sand/gravel). How these environmental 
characteristics of the site influence the prey of harbour porpoise or other aspects of their life 
directly (e.g. breeding/calving) is currently unknown. 


 


4 Advice on Activities 


4.1 Purpose of advice 


This section details the advice on human activities specifically occurring within or close to 
the Southern North Sea pSAC that would be expected to impact the site. Initial assessments 
were done at UK scale, with subsequent site level assessment detailing our understanding 
of impacts occurring with potential to affect harbour porpoise when using the site (Section 5 
& 6).  Advice is only given where pressures8 may act at the site level and therefore, may 
require management if the Conservation Objectives are to be met. Wide-spread pressures 
may also act to affect the overall status of harbour porpoise, but such effects are not 
restricted to specific sites. Such pressures are best dealt with through broader measures. 
Alongside and in addition to the identification of the network of harbour porpoise sites, an 
overarching conservation strategy (DETR, 2000) has been in place for harbour porpoise 
since 2000. In light of a recent conservation literature review (IAMMWG et al 2015b), this 
strategy will be reviewed and updated where necessary.  


The advice identifies activities with potential to affect harbour porpoise using the site (site 
level impacts) as well as (where possible) its supporting habitats in UK waters which may 
impact the species’ capacity to maintain FCS. This advice should also be used to help 
identify the extent to which existing activities are, or can be made, consistent with the 
conservation objectives, and thereby focus the attention of Relevant and Competent 
Authorities and surveillance programmes to areas that may need management measures. 


                                                
8
 See Annex A for definition of key terms 
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This draft advice on activities will be updated and supplemented through further discussions 
with the Relevant and Competent Authorities and any advisory groups formed for the site. 


 


4.2 Background 


In compiling this advice on activities, the SNCBs have considered the pressures that may be 
caused by human activities and the sensitivity of the qualifying feature, harbour porpoise, to 
those pressures. The advice is generated through a broad grading of sensitivity and 
exposure of the harbour porpoise to pressures associated with activities in order to gain an 
understanding of how vulnerable the species is to each activity at a UK level.  The activities 
and their associated pressures to which the harbour porpoise is deemed vulnerable at UK 
level are then considered at site level in order to inform possible management needs 
necessary for the site to meet the conservation objectives. Annex A details the approach 
taken to identify the significant impacts on harbour porpoise from pressures, and the relative 
sensitivity and current exposure of harbour porpoise to those pressures at a UK wide scale. 


This document is guidance only and activities and their management will be considered in 
the context of Habitats Regulations Assessments/Appropriate Assessment and where 
applicable through other environmental  assessment processes (e.g. EIA).   


   


5 Activity assessments at UK scale 
The assessments have been carried out using all available evidence as of November 2015. 
As further information becomes available, assessments may be subject to alteration in line 
with the new evidence to support the change, and further improving the understanding of the 
vulnerability of harbour porpoise to activities occurring in UK waters. This advice is made 
without prejudice to any assessment that may be required for specific proposals to be 
considered by a Relevant Authority. The level of any impact will depend on the location, 
timing and intensity of the relevant activity. This advice is provided to assist and focus the 
Relevant Authorities in their consideration of the management of these activities.  


The harbour porpoise is a wide-ranging species and occurs throughout the UK Continental 
Shelf area (JNCC, 2013). It does occur in deeper waters but in very low densities, and 
perhaps only seasonally. As a predominantly shelf species, it is exposed to a wide range of 
pressures, that are both ubiquitous (e.g. pollution) and patchy (e.g. bycatch) in nature, and 
the list of anthropogenic activities leading to these pressures is long. Based on current 
available information, the activities with the most notable impact on UK harbour porpoise are 
shown in Table 1. 


The definitions of the pressures as applied within harbour porpoise SAC advice can be found 
in Annex B 


Activities which currently pose a low risk to porpoises at the UK level (Annex A, Table A2) 
have not been considered in this advice. The exposure to the pressures associated with 
these activities is currently very limited and poses no significant threat to the maintenance of 
harbour porpoise FCS.  Non-anthropogenic impacts are also not considered, such as attack 
and predation from other marine mammal species, that have the potential to impact harbour 
porpoise populations.  


The full list of assessed activities and key references can be found in Annex A, Table A3.  
Updates to the assessments will occur as more evidence becomes available.  
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Table 1: Key activities and the relative risk of impacts on harbour porpoise throughout UK waters. 
Those pressures ranked ‘high’ are known to have the greatest impact relative to other pressures on 
the population of UK harbour porpoises. 


Activities Pressures Impacts Current 
relative level 
of impact  


Commercial fisheries with 
bycatch of harbour porpoise 
(predominantly static nets) 


Removal of 
non-target 
species 


 Mortality through 
entanglement/bycatch 


High 


Discharge/run-off from land-
fill, terrestrial and offshore 
industries 


Contaminants  Affects on water and prey 
quality 


 Bioaccumulation through 
contaminated prey ingestion 


 Health issues (e.g. on 
reproduction) 


High 


Shipping, drilling, dredging 
and disposal, aggregate 
extraction, pile driving, 
acoustic surveys, 
underwater explosion, 
military activity, acoustic 
deterrent devices and 
recreational boating activity 


Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 


 Mortality 


 Internal injury 


 Disturbance leading to 
physical and acoustic 
behavioural changes 
(potentially impacting 
foraging, navigation, 
breeding, socialising) 


Medium 


Shipping, recreational 
boating, tidal energy 
installations 


Death or injury 
by collision 


 Mortality 


 Injury 


Medium/Low 


Commercial fisheries 
(reduction in prey resources) 


Removal of 
target species 


 Reduction in food availability 


 Increased competition from 
other species 


 Displacement from natural 
range 


Medium  


 


Removal of non-target species (harbour porpoise bycatch) 


Bycatch of harbour porpoise in fishing gear is one of the most significant anthropogenic 
pressures impacting on the population. The relevant commercial fisheries with harbour 
porpoise bycatch are certain bottom set nets. The areas where bycatch is of greatest 
concern is off southwest England and the southern North Sea. Mitigation of bycatch through 
the use of acoustic deterrent devices (‘pingers’) is required under EU Regulation 812/20049 
on setnet vessels of 12m or over. However, smaller set net vessels (<12m) comprise the 
majority of the fleet and are the major source of harbour porpoise bycatch in UK waters. 
Where the bycatch/risk of bycatch within porpoise SACs threatens the sites’ integrity, 
mitigation maybe required.   


 


Contaminants 


The latest evidence (Law et al 1992-2005 & 2009; Law et al 2008; ASCOBANS, 2011; 
Murphy et al 2015) shows that there is still a significant pollution issue for at least some 
cetacean species in European waters, which includes harbour porpoise and organochlorines 


(e.g. Polychlorinated biphenyls [PCBs]). Monitoring and investigation will continue to be 


important, and research in this field should not remain focused on ‘old’ compounds and 


                                                
9
 http://eur-lex.europa.eu/LexUriServ/LexUriServ.do?uri=OJ:L:2004:150:0012:0031:EN:PDF 


 



http://eur-lex.europa.eu/LexUriServ/LexUriServ.do?uri=OJ:L:2004:150:0012:0031:EN:PDF
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contaminants. Careful consideration is required to ensure we also monitor historical 
contaminant impacts as well as any current or emerging issues.  


 


Anthropogenic underwater sound 


Harbour porpoise use sound for foraging, navigation, social activities and predator detection. 
Changes in underwater noise therefore have the potential to interrupt these behaviours. The 
peak frequency of echolocation pulses produced by harbour porpoise is 120–130 kHz, 
corresponding to their peak hearing sensitivity although hearing occurs throughout the range 
of ~1 and 180 kHz (Southall et al 2007). A range of activities emit sound that falls within the 
hearing sensitivities of porpoise, including shipping, pile driving, Acoustic Deterrent Devices 
and military activities. The exact frequency, intensity and longevity of the sound will 
determine the response. The impact on the porpoise is also mediated through individual 
behaviour, and perhaps quality of its immediate habitat, at the time of exposure.  


 


Death or injury by collision  


Post-mortem evidence indicates that few collisions between harbour porpoise and vessels 
occur and is not a significant pressure for this species.  


Research surrounding wet renewables shows potential risk of harbour porpoise collision with 
sub-marine turbines, although there is no evidence of such collisions to date.  


 


Removal of target species (harbour porpoise prey) 


Porpoise diet within UK waters includes a wide variety of fish and they will generally focus on 
the most abundant local species (De Pierrepont et al 2005; Camphuysen et al 2006). The 
predominant prey type in general appears to be whiting, gobies and sandeel, although 
shoaling fish such as mackerel and herring are also taken. In the north-east Atlantic, a long 
term shift from predation on clupeid fish (mainly herring) to predation on sandeels and 
gadoid fish, possibly related to the decline in herring stocks since the mid-1960s has been 
observed. Porpoise diets overlap extensively with diets of other piscivorous marine predators 
(notably seals) and many of the main prey species are also taken by commercial fisheries, 
although porpoises tend to take smaller fish than those targeted by fisheries (Santos and 
Pierce 2003).  


 


6 Site specific considerations: Southern North Sea pSAC 


6.1 Sensitivity of harbour porpoise to existing activities within or impacting on the 


site  


The Southern North Sea site spans territorial and offshore waters and covers a large 
geographical area. A summary of the site can be found in the Selection Assessment 
Document10. Precise information on many activities within the boundary is not currently 
available due to lack of targeted data collection to date. Assessing exposure carries certain 
assumptions about the spatial extent, frequency and intensity of the pressures associated 
with marine activities. Therefore site based exposure and resulting current level of impact 
has not been assessed at this stage.   


                                                
10


 SAC Selection Assessment Document: 


 http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/pdf/SouthernNorthSeaSelectionAssessmentDocument.pdf 



http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/pdf/SouthernNorthSeaSelectionAssessmentDocument.pdf





11 
 


Table 2 is an overview of activities occurring within or in proximity to the Southern North Sea 
site to which the harbour porpoise has a current level of impact risk of High or Medium at UK 
level (Table 1) and therefore may require further consideration concerning options for 
management. This was derived from spatial data as GIS layers and a review of the literature, 
and includes all available data at time of writing.  


Management measures are the responsibility of the relevant regulatory bodies, which 
consider the SNCBs’ advice and hold appropriate discussions with the sector concerned, but 
the scale and type of mitigation is decided by the Regulators. Where consent is required and 
the activity (if considered a plan or a project) is likely to significantly affect a European 
Marine site, Article 6(3) of the Habitats Directive requires that an Appropriate Assessment is 
carried out. Assessments under Article 6(3) of the Directive are often referred to in the UK as 
“Habitat Regulations Assessments” (HRA). The HRA is a case-specific assessment made in 
view of the Conservation Objectives for the affected site. Each HRA requires case-specific, 
unbiased advice from the SNCB but is the responsibility of the regulatory body concerned.  


In 2012 the UK Government adopted a revised approach to the management of fishing 
activities within European marine sites (EMS) in England. The revised approach is designed 
to ensure the consistency of the management of fishing activities with Article 6 of the 
Habitats Directive.  Risk based prioritisation of managing the fishing activities of UK and non 
UK vessels has been applied to relevant European marine site features and sub features  
within the UK 12nm territorial limit. For EMS outside of 12nm, or sites outside 6nm where 
there are access rights for other Member States, management measures designed to ensure 
adequate protection are to be proposed to and agreed by the European Commission in 
accordance with the Common Fisheries Policy (CFP). 


 


Table 2: Activities occurring within/near to the Southern North Sea site to which the harbour porpoise 


is considered sensitive.  


Activities Pressure Comment on current 
level of activity  


Management considerations 


Commercial 
fisheries (with 
harbour 
porpoise 
bycatch) 


Removal of 
non-target 
(bycatch) 
species 


UK registered vessels 
>12m: Negligible effort 
of Vessel Monitoring 
System (VMS) 
registered vessels using 
static net gears within 
the site
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UK registered vessels 
<12m: current exposure 
is unknown 


EU registered vessels: 
higher effort of static net 
setting than UK vessels 
with two concentrated 
areas.  Effort in the 
south east appears to 
have increased between 
2009 and 2013.  


Where management measures are 
required, the development of these 
would be undertaken via discussion 
with fishing interests and fishery 
managers and informed by any 
detailed information about fishing 
activity that can be made available. 
Detailed measures, if required, will be 
developed by the relevant regulator 
(European 
Commission/MMO/IFCA/Defra) 
 
The use of pingers as a mitigation 
measure is required on static nets 
deployed by vessels >12m in length in 
specified areas through EU 
Regulation 812/2004. Through 
derogation, this part of the UK fleet 
currently utilise the DDD.  
 
Because bycatch most often occurs in 
bottom set nets deployed from 
vessels <12m, and the use of pingers 
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 The fisheries data are aggregated VMS data collected between 2006 and 2013. 
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is not mandatory under Regulation 
812/2004, one option for 
management could be to extend the 
pinger requirement to further vessels. 
The risk of bycatch from this sector in 
the context of the Conservation 
objectives of the site will need to be  
established . Such a requirement may 
have a seasonal component. 
However, further work is needed to 
understand the scale of disturbance 
that would be caused by wide-spread 
deployment of the different types of 
pinger.   


Discharge/run-
off from land-fill, 
terrestrial/ 
offshore 
industries 


Contaminants Current exposure 
within/near the site is 
unknown  


This pressure cannot be managed 
effectively at the site level. Most of the 
relevant pollutants have been 
effectively phased out of use by 
action under the OSPAR Convention 
and, more recently, the EU (e.g. 
PCBs). However, their chemical 
stability will lead to them remaining in 
the marine environment for some time 
and, consequently, human activities 
such as dredging may cause the re-
release of these chemicals into the 
environment or introduce other 
contaminants of which the impacts 
are poorly known.  


Any novel sources of potential 
contamination associated with a new 
plan or project may be assessed 
under HRA. It is recognised that 
further efforts to limit or eliminate PCB 
discharges to the marine environment 
may still be needed.  


Shipping Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 


Several large ports 
along the East coast of 
England resulting in 
large vessel shipping 
routes throughout the 
site.   


The underwater sounds created by 
large ships are unlikely to cause 
physical trauma, but could make 
preferred habitats less attractive as a 
result of disturbance (habitat 
displacement, area avoidance).  
However, additional management is 
unlikely to be required given current 
levels within the site and elevated 
densities of porpoises in this area. 


Oil and gas 
drilling 


Areas licensed for oil 
and gas extraction in the 
northern and central 
parts of the site 


This is a highly regulated industry. 
Existing and inactive (exploratory and 
dry) wells and oil and gas licensed 
blocks occur within the suite of 
proposed sites and any future 
applications would be subject to an 
HRA.  


Dredging and 
disposal 


Capital dredging and 
disposal sites in the 
southern portion of the 


Dredging and disposal can cause 
disturbance leading to physical and 
acoustic behavioural changes. 



file:///C:/Users/lindis%20bergland/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.Outlook/8RWT203W/%20Additional

file:///C:/Users/lindis%20bergland/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.Outlook/8RWT203W/%20Additional
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site However, the risk is considered 
relatively low and additional 
management is unlikely to be required 


Aggregate 
extraction 


Extensive existing 
licensed and active 
areas within the site 


Aggregate extraction can cause 
disturbance leading to physical and 
acoustic behavioural changes. 
However, the risk is considered 
relatively low and additional 
management is unlikely to be required 


Pile driving Current and licensed 
areas for offshore wind, 
including construction 
and maintenance 
phases within the site  


A European Protected Species (EPS) 
licence is already required for any 
construction activity which carries the 
risk of significant disturbance or injury 
As a minimum, developers are 
required to follow the ‘Statutory 
Nature Conservation Agency protocol 
for minimising the risk of injury to 
marine mammals from piling noise’. 
(https://www.gov.uk/government/uplo
ads/system/uploads/attachment_data/
file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf). 
 
A Habitats Regulations Assessment 
(HRA) will be considered for all new 
developments (coastal and marine) 
using pile driving within the site or 
within 26km (see Dahne et al 2013; 
Tougaard et al 2014) of site 
boundaries. If additional mitigation (to 
that required under EPS licence) is 
required, planning and management 
of pile driving activities may be 
needed within the site to ensure the 
Conservation Objectives are met. 
There is potential for a reduction or 
limitation of the 
disturbance/displacement effects by 
varying the schedule of piling, 
particularly if several developments 
are constructing at the same time and 
pile driving footprints do not overlap 
(i.e maximising area from which 
porpoise are excluded). Limited 
spatio-temporal restrictions may be 
needed.  


Other examples of mitigation include 
the use of sound dampers, methods 
that create a barrier to sound transfer 
(e.g. bubble curtains) and, more 
effectively, the use of alternative 
foundation types (e.g. gravity 
foundations, suction cups, floating 
turbines, drilling). Scheduling of 
activities may minimise cumulative 
exclusion from areas.   


Acoustic 
(including 


Seismic exploration 
Some geophysical surveys within 5km 
of site boundary may require consent 



https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf
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seismic) 
surveys 


activity occurs in the site and be subject to HRA. 


Seismic surveys are likely to require 
an EPS licence which may specify 
conditions. As a minimum, it is 
expected that developers will adhere 
to the JNCC Guidelines for minimising 
the risk of injury and disturbance to 
marine mammals from seismic 
surveys (updated August 2010; 
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploa
ds/system/uploads/attachment_data/fi


le/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf) 


Recreational 
boating activity 


Royal Yachting 
Association (RYA) 
cruising routes across 
the extent of the site, 
focussed along the 
coast 


Adherence to wildlife codes of 
conduct is already advocated (e.g the 
WiSe scheme 
http://www.wisescheme.org  ). No 
further management measures are 
likely to be required. 


Acoustic 
deterrent/ 
mitigation 
devices 


Unknown, no consistent 
areas of usage but 
maybe used as a 
mitigation tool during 
pile driving. 


See pile driving.  


Pinger devices 
31 UK registered >12m 
setnet boats of which 4 
use pingers in the area 
of the site.  Use in North 
Sea on vessels under 
12m is unknown but 
likely low.  


See ‘Fisheries (commercial and 
recreational) with harbour porpoise 
bycatch’ 


The use of pingers is low/not needed 
in the site. 


Shipping Death or injury 
by collision 


Several large ports 
along the East coast of 
England resulting in 
busy shipping routes 
throughout the site, with 
the highest level of 
activity in the south.   


Post mortem investigations of harbour 
porpoise deaths have revealed death 
caused by trauma (potentially linked 
with vessel strikes) is not currently 
considered a significant risk and no 
additional management is therefore 
required.  


Recreational 
boating activity 


RYA cruising routes 
cross the site, most are 
coastal 


See ‘Shipping’ (with death or injury by 
collision).  
 
Boats conducting recreational activity 
should adhere to wildlife codes of 
conduct (e.g the WiSe scheme 
http://www.wisescheme.org/). 
 
 


Commercial 
fisheries 


Removal of 
target (prey) 
species 


Fisheries targeting prey 
species such as whiting, 
herring, mackerel, 
sandeel and sprat 
throughout their ranges 
in the North Sea, fished 
by UK and EU fisheries.  


Commercial species are managed at 
the larger scale through the CFP.  
.  



https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf

http://www.wisescheme.org/
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6.2 Limitations of the evidence 


It is important to note that the information used to catalogue activities occurring within the 
site is not complete. The available data are drawn from existing monitoring programmes 
(e.g. the UK’s bycatch of protected species monitoring and other European datasets linked 
to VMS monitoring of fishing vessels) but these have limitations including availability and 
accessibility at the time of preparing this advice. Caveats with how the data have been 
collected also need to be understood in order to correctly interpret the information. This can 
result in the use of expert judgement where sufficient evidence is lacking, but risk is implied. 
Below are some points to consider alongside the above table in order to ensure the 
information is not taken out of context:  


 Data availability 
o Globally, the marine environment is generally far behind the evidence levels of 


that on land, particularly in offshore areas, mainly due to scale and cost. 
o Sensitivities surround data that has been gathered by industry, and some data 


are not available for use for advice and management purposes. Often these data 
become available eventually, but not in time to inform management decisions.  
 


 Fishing: Limitations of fishing Vessel Monitoring System (VMS) data 
o VMS positional data are transmitted at approximately 2 hour intervals. There is 


no information transmitted regarding precise vessel activity, therefore 
assumptions on its activity are often made using the location of the vessel and its 
speed profile. 


o Fishing vessels under 12m, (and until 2013, vessels under 15m long) are not 
required to use the VMS, and therefore VMS data tells us nothing regarding the 
activity of this segment of the fleet. However, relevant data can be obtained from 
Association of Inshore Fisheries and Conservation (IFCAs) and will be used to 
develop more detailed guidance to assist with identification of any management 
measures.    


 


 Contaminants 
o Although use of many substances that have contaminated the environment is 


now illegal, re-suspension or reintroduction of pollutants that were used 
historically occurs. It is also difficult to identify sources of contamination when 
dealing with highly mobile species.    
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8 Annex A: Assessment process to establish the significant 
threats to UK harbour porpoise populations 


The sensitivity and vulnerability of harbour porpoise was assessed at UK level against the 
pressure themes identified by OSPAR’s Intersessional Correspondence Group on 
Coordination of Biodiversity Assessment and Monitoring (ICG-COBAM)12 which have been 
adapted slightly in order to suit the application of a highly mobile species. See Annex B for 
the definitions of pressures as used for the harbour porpoise assessments. 


 


Definition of key terms 


Term Definition 


Pressure theme  A group of like-pressures defined by ICG-COBAM 


Sensitivity A measure of tolerance (or intolerance) to changes in environmental conditions 


Vulnerability 
Vulnerability is a measure of the degree of exposure of a receptor to a pressure to 
which it is sensitive. 


Pressure 
The mechanism through which an activity has an effect on any part of the 
ecosystem’. The nature of the pressure is determined by activity type, intensity 
and distribution. 


Impact The effects (or consequences) of a pressure on a component. 


Impact Risk The current  risk of impact 


Exposure 
The action of a pressure on a receptor, with regard to the extent, magnitude and 
duration of the pressure. 


Activity 
Human social or economic action or endeavours that may create pressures on the 
marine environment. 


Source: jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-6515 


 


Determining the level of impact risk of harbour porpoise to an activity 


 


Sensitivity  


Harbour porpoises were assessed as sensitive to a pressure when viability of an individual 
(including physiological stress, reduced fecundity, reduced growth) would be negatively 
affected and recovery did not take place rapidly (within weeks). The assessment 
incorporated expert judgement where required and adopted a single threshold to 
differentiate only between ‘sensitive’ and ‘not sensitive’.  The pressures that harbour 
porpoise are deemed sensitive to are listed in Table A1.  


  


                                                
12


 OSPAR 20011: https://ospar.basecamphq.com/projects/6526112-icg-cobam/log 


Feature 
(Harbour porpoise) 


Current 
level of 


impact risk Exposure 
to activity 


Sensitivity 
to activity 



https://ospar.basecamphq.com/projects/6526112-icg-cobam/log
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Table A1: Pressures to which harbour porpoise may be sensitive.  


Pressure Theme Pressures 
Direct or Indirect  
impact 


Pollution and other 
chemical changes 


Contamination  
Indirect  – prey and 
habitat 


Enrichment Indirect - habitat 


 
Other physical 
pressures 
 


Litter Direct  


Anthropogenic underwater sound  Direct 


Barrier to species movement Direct 


Death or injury by collision Direct 


 
Biological pressures 
 


Introduction of microbial pathogens Direct 


Removal of target species Direct 


Removal of non-target species Direct 


 


Exposure  


The list of pressures to which harbour porpoise is sensitive was combined with evidence of 
general exposure to these pressures in UK waters to get an understanding of the current 
level of impact risk; it combined expert knowledge on the overlap in spatial and temporal 
distributions of activities contributing towards a pressure and harbour porpoise densities, 
with direct evidence of impact as reported in the literature and from the UK Cetacean 
Strandings Investigation Programme13.  


 


Current level of impact risk 


Caution was applied throughout the assessment process where there was a lack of direct 
evidence of exposure to an activity; a pressure to which a species was sensitive, was 
assumed to overlap with that species unless a case could be made to the contrary. In this 
sense, lack of direct evidence of exposure does not imply the species is not currently at risk. 
The current level of impact risk of harbour porpoise has not been assessed on a site basis 
due to uncertainties in exposure, driven by incomplete evidence to support the assessment 
at the site scale. The following level of impact scores were chosen to represent harbour 
porpoise vulnerability to activities within UK waters:  


Scores 
Criteria for overlap in space & time 
between pressure & species 


Evidence of impact 


Low  None or limited No direct evidence in UK waters 


Medium Some Some evidence of an impact occurring in UK waters 


High Widespread Good evidence of a significant impact 


 


The evidence used to assess the current level of impact is summarised in Table A3 and 
subsequent reference list. 


Activities with a level of impact risk of ‘low’ have not been considered in the site 
assessments unless there is evidence to support a significant vulnerability despite the 
criteria described in the table above. This assessment, although inclusive of expert 
judgement in order to arrive at the assessment outcomes at UK level, provide a base from 
which to apply weighting to site based sensitivity assessments, using all available activity 
data.   


                                                
13


 UK Cetacean Strandings Investigation Programme: http://ukstrandings.org/ 



http://ukstrandings.org/
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Table A2: Full assessment of level of impact of activities on harbour porpoise in UK waters. 


Activities Pressures Impacts 


Current 
level of 
impact 
risk  


Commercial fisheries with 
bycatch (predominantly 
static nets) 


Removal of non-
target species 


 Mortality through 
entanglement/bycatch 


High 


Discharge/run-off from land-
fill, terrestrial and offshore 
industries 


Contaminants 


 Affects on water and prey quality 


 bioaccumulation through 
contaminated prey ingestion 


 health issues (e.g. on 
reproduction) 


High 


Noise from shipping, drilling, 
dredging and disposal, 
aggregate extraction, pile 
driving, acoustic surveys, 
underwater explosion, 
military activity, acoustic 
deterrent devices and 
recreational boating activity 


Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 


 Mortality 


 Internal injury 


 disturbance leading to physical 
and acoustic behavioural changes 
(potentially impacting foraging, 
navigation, breeding, socialising) 


Medium 


Shipping, recreational 
boating, renewable energy 
installations 


Death or injury 
by collision 


 Mortality 


 Injury 


Medium/
Low 


Commercial fisheries, 
bycatch 


Removal of 
target species 


 Reduction in food availability 


 increased competition from other 
species 


 displacement from natural range 


Medium 


Agriculture, aquaculture, 
sewage 


Nutrient 
enrichment 


 Affects on water quality 


 increased risk of algal blooms 
 may present health issues 


Low 


Agriculture, aquaculture, 
sewage 


Organic 
enrichment 


 Affects on water quality 


 increased risk of algal blooms 
may present health issues 


Low 


Waste disposal - 
navigational dredging 
(capital, maintenance) 


Physical change 
(to another 
seabed type) 


 Changes in availability of prey 
species 


Low 


Bridges, tunnels, dams, 
installations, presence of 
vessels (shipping, 
recreation) 


Water flow (tidal 
current) 
changes - local 


 Changes in location of prey 
species 
Displacement of harbour porpoise 


Low 


Terrestrial and at-sea 
‘disposal’ 


Litter 
 Mortality through entanglement 


Ingestion 
Low 


Bridges, tunnels, dams, 
installations, presence of 
vessels (shipping, 
recreation) 


Barrier to 
species 
movement 


 Habitat inaccessible  
potential physiological effects 


Low 


Sewage 
Introduction of 
microbial 
pathogens 


 Increased risk of disease Low 
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Table A3: Evidence used to assess exposure to each pressure to which harbour porpoise is 
considered sensitive.  


Example activities linked to each pressure are listed.  


Key activities 
linked to 
pressures 


Pressures Evidence 


Key references 
 


S
p
a
ti
a


l 
o
v
e
rl


a
p
 


(s
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e
c
ie


s
 &


 


p
re


s
s
u
re


) 


P
o
s
t-


m
o
rt


e
m


 


e
x
a
m


in
a
ti
o
n


 


Discharge/run-off 
from land-fill, 
terrestrial and 
offshore industries 


Contaminants   


Jepson et al 2005; Deaville & Jepson, 2011; 
ICES, 2015a; Van De Vijver et al 2003; Law et al 
2012; Pierce et al 2008; Murphy et al 2015. 


Agriculture, 
aquaculture, 
sewage 


Nutrient 
enrichment 


 


 
 Craig et al 2013 


Agriculture, 
aquaculture’ 
sewage 


Organic 
enrichment   Craig et al 2013 


Terrestrial and at-
sea ‘disposal’ 


Litter 
 


 


 


 
Deaville and Jepson, 2011 


Marine renewable 
energy 


Electromagnetic 
changes   WGMME, 2012, ICES 2015a 


Shipping, drilling, 
dredging, pile 
driving, military 
sonar, seismic 
surveys 


Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 


  


Deaville & Jepson, 2011; Stone & Tasker, 2006; 
Stone, 2015; Jepson et al 2005; Fernandez et al 


2005; Würsig & Richardson, 2009; WGMME, 
2012.  


Bridges, tunnels, 
dams, installations 


Barrier to 
species 
movement 


  
WGMME., 2012; ICES 2015a 
 


Shipping, 
recreational 
boating, renewable 
energy devices 


Death or injury 
by collision 


 


 


 


 


Deaville & Jepson, 2011; Dolman et al 2006; 
ICES 2015a 


Sewage 
Introduction of 
microbial 
pathogens 


  
Harvell et al 1999; Gulland and Hall, 2007; Van 
Bressem et al 2009 


Commercial 
fisheries 


Removal of 
target species 


  


Simmonds and Isaac, 2007; OSPAR QSR 2010;  
MacLeod et al 2007a, b; Thompson et al 2007; 
Santos and Pierce, 2003; Pierce et al 2007; 
ICES 2015a 


Commercial 
fisheries with by-
catch 


Removal of non-
target species 


 


 


 


 


Deaville and Jepson, 2011; Morizur et al 1999; 


Read et al 2006; Northridge, S. and Kingston, 
A. 2010; Northridge et al 2013; ICES 2015b 
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9 Annex B: Definitions of Pressures as applied within harbour 
porpoise SAC Advice on Activities 


 


Pressures Definition in the context of harbour porpoise advice 


Removal of non-target species The removal of species not targeted by the fishery; in this 
case the bycatch (and probable mortality) of harbour 
porpoise 


Contaminants Introduced material capable of contaminating harbour 
porpoise, prey or habitat important to harbour porpoise, 
with a negative impact directly or indirectly on porpoises 


Anthropogenic underwater sound Introduced noise in a frequency with the potential to cause 
injury or displace harbour porpoise from their natural range 


Death or injury by collision Introduction of physical objects; mobile or immobile, that 
may collide with or result in potential collision of harbour 
porpoise resulting in injury or mortality 


Removal of target species Removal of harbour porpoise prey, resulting in increased 
competition amongst porpoise and other species, and/or 
displacement from their natural range 
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ExA Question F3.1 Natural England Comments 


 
There are differing views before the Examination on the appropriate 
parameters to use in collision risk modelling (CRM). The Examining 
Authority (ExA) has not concluded on these matters and will continue 
to consider all points of view. The request to re-run the CRM set out 
below may assist the ExA. The ExA will take any results into account 
together with all other evidence on this topic.  
 
Please run the CRM using the digital aerial survey data with the 
following species-specific parameters:  
 
Bird Length (m)  
Gannet 0.94 (Robinson 2017)  
Kittiwake 0.39 (Robinson 2017)  
Lesser black-backed gull 0.58 (Robinson 2017)  
Great black-backed gull 0.71 (Robinson 2017)  
Herring gull 0.60 (Robinson 2017)  
 
Wing Span (m)  
Gannet 1.72 (Robinson 2017)  
Kittiwake 1.08 (Robinson 2017)  
Lesser black-backed gull 1.42 (Robinson 2017)  
Great black-backed gull 1.58 (Robinson 2017)  
Herring gull 1.44 (Robinson 2017)  
 
Flight Type  
Gannet Flapping  
Kittiwake Flapping  
Lesser black-backed gull Flapping  
Great black-backed gull Flapping  
Herring gull Flapping 
 
Upwind Flights (%)  
Gannet 50  


In response to the ExA’s request to present CRM figures using the 
avoidance rates in Bowgen and Cook (2018) Natural England note: 


The Applicant stated in REP6-042 that “It should be noted that JNCC 
have just revised their advice on avoidance rates in light of the ORJIP 
study (Bowgen and Cook (2018), report included in Appendix 14) and 
the rates recommended in this report have also been presented.”  


Natural England note that JNCC have not revised their advice on 
avoidance rates in light of the ORJIP study or the analysis presented in 
the Bowgen and Cook (2018) report. 


Natural England’s position remains that the appropriate avoidance rates 
to use with Band (2012) model are those set out in the SNCB guidance 
note: JNCC et al (2014), as provided in advice to Hornsea Three 
through the Evidence Working Group process, Scoping and PEiR 
stages of the Application as well as to other projects currently in the 
planning system, such as Norfolk Vanguard. 


Natural England additionally note that the avoidance rates listed by the 
ExA do not include standard deviations. SNCB guidance on the use of 
avoidance rates in CRM specifically advises that “Collision mortality 
estimates should be presented using the mean total avoidance rate (as 
detailed in Table 1 below) as well as a range of avoidance rates that 
reflects the variability and uncertainty linked to it (i.e. ±2SD)” JNCC et al 
(2014).  Failure to account for this variability and uncertainty means that 
it is not possible to assess the range of potential mortality resulting from 
collisions, or the significance of the resulting population level impacts. 


Natural England also note that the Avoidance Rates listed by the ExA 
contain a mixed selection of rates taken from Bowgen and Cook (2018) 
some of which refer to the Basic Band model and some to the Extended 
Band model in Bowgen and Cook (2018). Natural England considers 
that it is confusing to present these numbers with no information about 
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Kittiwake 50  
Lesser black-backed gull 50  
Great black-backed gull 50  
Herring gull 50  
 
Flight Height Proportions  
Gannet Option 1  
Kittiwake Option 1  
Lesser black-backed gull Option 3 (Johnston et al. 2014)  
Great black-backed gull Option 3 (Johnston et al. 2014)  
Herring gull Option 3 (Johnston et al. 2014)  
 
As in the original analysis [APP-109], the 35m band as well as the 
combined 35m and 30m band should be analysed from the boat-
based surveys to provide a precautionary estimate.  
 
Flight Speed  
Gannet 14.9 m/sec (Pennycuick et al. 1987)  
Kittiwake 13.1 m/sec (Pennycuick et al. 1987)  
Lesser black-backed gull 13.1 m/sec (Alerstam et al. 2007)  
Great black-backed gull 13.7 m/sec (Alerstam et al. 2007)  
Herring gull 12.8 m/sec (Alerstam et al. 2007)  
 
Avoidance Rates  
Gannet 0.995 (Bowgen and Cook 2018)  
Kittiwake 0.990 (Bowgen and Cook 2018)  
Lesser black-backed gull 0.993 (Bowgen and Cook 2018)  
Great black-backed gull 0.993 (Bowgen and Cook 2018)  
Herring gull 0.993 (Bowgen and Cook 2018)  
 
Nocturnal Activity Factors  
Gannet 1-2 (Furness 2018/Garthe & Hüppop 2004)  
Kittiwake 2-3 (Furness 2018/Garthe & Hüppop 2004)  
Lesser black-backed gull 3 (Garthe and Hüppop 2004) 
Great black-backed gull 3 (Garthe and Hüppop 2004)  
Herring gull 3 (Garthe and Hüppop 2004)  
 


what they refer to, or any context to explain why, for example, a rate that 
applies to the Basic Band Model is listed for kittiwake but a rate that 
applies to the Extended Band Model is listed for Herring gull.  


In response to the ExA’s request regarding “Flight Height Proportions”: 


Natural England note that the flight height proportions are not specified 
by the Band Model Options (e.g. Option 1 or Option 3). The Band Model 
option only specifies whether the collision risk model requires the user to 
input a site specific proportion of birds at collision height (for Option 1) or 
whether the model will calculate a height based collision risk from a 
flight height distribution that is added to the “Flightheight” worksheet of 
the Band Model workbook. Natural England note that the ExA’s 
comment about the boat-based surveys implies that the ExA is asking 
the Applicant to derive a proportion of birds at collision height (as would 
be required for use with Option 1) from the boat based survey data that 
the Applicant used in APP-109. Natural England further notes that the 
ExA is asking the Applicant to run the CRM using the “35m band as well 
as the 30m and 35m band combined”.  


The turbine parameters documented in APP-109 indicate that the lower 
rotor tip is predicted to be between 31.97 and 34.97 metres above sea 
level depending in tidal state. 


The Applicant states in APP-109 that the 35 metre flight height band has 
been included to calculate the proportion of birds at PCH. Since the boat 
based data were collected in 5m height bands the Applicant has 
assumed that boat based observers considered that birds recorded in 
the 35 m band were in fact flying between 32.5m and 37.7m above sea 
level.  


The Applicant also used information on the number of birds flying in the 
30m band (which the Applicant assumes represents birds flying between 
27.5m and 32.5m above sea level) to calculate a PCH value that the 
Applicant used to provide a “upper confidence” PCH in APP-109.  
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Please use the wind farm parameters, as defined in Table 1.4 of the 
ES [APP 109] for the initial analysis and then increase the rotor tip 
height to 37.5m and 40m above LAT for subsequent runs in order to 
evaluate the effect of the mitigation that was proposed at ISH7.  
 
Please use the results of the analyses to refine the population viability 
analysis for each species and conclude on whether the potential 
collision impacts would lead to an adverse effect on the integrity of the 
Flamborough and Filey Coast SPA either alone or in combination with 
other plans or projects for relevant species. This evaluation should be 
based on the following assumptions:  
 
Apportioning  
Gannet  
Post-breeding 4.8%  
Breeding 63.3%  
Pre-breeding 6.2%  
Kittiwake  
Post-breeding 5.4%  
Breeding 41.7%  
Pre-breeding 7.2%  
 
Seasonality  
Gannet – Breeding March-September (Furness 2015)  
Gannet – Non-breeding October-February (Furness 2015)  
Kittiwake – Breeding March-August (Furness 2015)  
Kittiwake – Non-breeding September-February (Furness 2015)  
 
Please set out whether the above parameterisation and assumptions 
alter the conclusions of the ES and the RIAA and to what extent the 
proposed increases in rotor tip height might mitigate any negative 
impacts.  
 
If the Secretary of State were to conclude that an increase in rotor tip 
height would represent appropriate mitigation, could that be secured 
by amending the dimension in Requirement 2(2)(c) and in the 
corresponding design parameters in the Deemed Marine Licences?  


It is not clear whether the Applicant has used all records of birds in flight 
in the 30m and/or 35m and above bands to generate PCH values (as in 
previous assessments of the boat based data from the Hornsea Zone 
the numbers of birds in different bands have been reduced based on the 
proportion of the height band that the rotor height overlapped with). 


The respective PCH values of including the 35m band or the 30 + 35 m 
bands are 0.78% and 1.14% for kittiwake and 1.41% and 4.23% for 
gannet [APP-109]. 


Natural England have not seen the data used to derive PCH values for 
Hornsea Project Three, but Natural England understands that the 
Applicant derived PCH values from boat based survey data collected 
between 2010 and 2013 from transects that overlapped the HOW3 
+4km buffer area. 


Natural England provided extensive comments regarding our concerns 
about the Hornsea Project Zone boat-based datasets during the 
Hornsea Project 2 examination. These are documented in our Hornsea 
Project Two Relevant Representations (Appendix 1, paragraphs 24-30) 
and Written Representations (paragraph 6.5.34 – 6.5.37) and in our 
Hornsea Project 2 Deadline 5 Written representation paragraphs 3.22-
3.46. In summary our concerns are: 


1. About the accuracy with which boat based observers can record 
birds in flight to the nearest 5m height level; 


2. About the false precision resulting from assignment of birds in 
flight to height bands (0-2.5m, 2.5-7.5m, 7.5-12.5m, 12.5-17.5, 
17.5-22.5, 22.5-27.5, 27.5-32.5 etc); 


3. About how the data in the 5m bands were processed to generate 
PCH values aligning with specific turbine rotor heights; 


4. About a lack of information regarding what the boat based 
observers recording protocol actually was. 


The baseline survey data for seabirds at Hornsea Project One and Two 
were collected using boat based observers. Birds in flight were recorded 
using a snapshot method which involves observers making an 
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Would any consequential amendments be required?  


  


 


instantaneous record of all birds flying over the transect and within 300m 
distance ahead of the ship, at survey intervals of one minute as the boat 
moves along the transect line.  


Natural England were not able to get clarification during the Hornsea 
Project Two examination about the exact methodology that was used to 
collect flight height data. According to Smartwind 20151 “A snapshot 
method was used for flying birds, which takes the ship’s speed into 
account and prevents overestimation of seabird densities. In addition, 
the estimated height of flying birds was also recorded, to the nearest 5 
m. The count interval for surveys was one minute, and synchronised 
GPS recorders were used to record the vessel position every minute”. It 
is not clear from this description of methods whether observers on the 
boat were recording birds in the five metre bands listed by the Applicant 
(e.g. 0-2.5, 2.5-7.5m, 7.5-12.5m, 12.5-17.5m, 17.5-22.5m, 22.5-27.5m 
etc.) or alternatively were recording birds to the nearest 5 m (e.g. 5m, 
10m 15m 20m etc.) and these were then subsequently post-processed 
such that, for example, birds recorded as flying at 20m were assigned to 
a 17.5-22.5m category. 


At Hornsea Project Two Natural England considered that “in designing a 
boat based survey protocol it would be unusual to instruct surveyors on 
a boat to collect and record data in height bands that include 0.5m 
boundary categories (such as to record birds in a 17.5 – 22.5 m height 
band), suggesting that the survey data was processed into these bands 
post collection”. 


Irrespective of this, Natural England does not consider that boat based 
observers can accurately assign flying birds into five metre height 
categories: 


Natural England Relevant Reps (HOW2): 


                                            
1 SMartWind (2015). Hornsea Offshore Wind Farm Project Two Environmental Statement Volume 5 - Offshore Annexes Chapter 5.5.1 Ornithology 
Technical Report. Part 2. PINS Document Reference: 7.5.5.1 APFP Regulation 5(2)(a), January 2015. 
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Preliminary data from a project undertaken for the Marine 
Renewables Ornithology Group (MROG, comprising the Joint 
Nature Conservation Committee (JNCC), Natural England (NE), 
Natural Resource Wales (NRW), Northern Ireland Environment 
Agency (NIEA), Scottish Natural Heritage (SNH), Marine 
Scotland Science (MSS) and the Royal Society for the Protection 
of Birds (RSPB)) involving a field trial using a hexocopter at 
known height, showed that boat based observers were only able 
to place the hexocopter in the correct 5m height band on 19% of 
occasions and that 59% of the incorrect flight band allocations 
were underestimates (i.e. observers placed the hexocopter in a 
lower 5m height band than the hexocopter was actually in). 
These were preliminary trials and a further trial is planned to 
confirm the results. The trial involved observers only having to 
record the height of a single object whereas boat based 
observers undertaking baseline surveys are required to count all 
birds present in the snapshot as well as identify the species, the 
flight height of all individuals and record behavioural information 
such as direction of flight and foraging behaviour. This is 
alongside the recording of birds on the water, all at one minute 
intervals.  Furthermore, collection of flight height data in 5m 
height bands is not standard practice for boat based 
observations. Typically boat-based observers assign birds to 
much coarser flight height bands such as 0 - 20m, 20 - 150m, 
and above 150m, equating to “below rotor sweep”, “within rotor 
sweep” or “above rotor sweep”. 


Due to the uncertainty in the flight height data collected for the Hornsea 
Project Two, Natural England advised Hornsea Project Two that Band 
Model Options (such as Option 2) which use generic flight height 
distribution data, and allow incorporation of upper and lower confidence 
limits around the flight height data, should be used for assessing 
collision risk for the project. 


Natural England’s position regarding the analysis and use of flight height 
data boat based survey data from the Hornsea Project Zone applies to 
Hornsea Project Three, and for this reason we do not consider that 
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Option 1 should be used for collision risk modelling and that Option 2 
should be used. This is consistent with advice given to other offshore 
windfarm projects where there have been issues with the site specific 
flight height data.  
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Natural England note that the avoidance rates listed against the collision figures in Tables 


42, 43, 44, and 45 for Herring gull [REP7-078] are incorrect. The Avoidance Rates in these 


tables should read 99.4, 99.5 and 99.6 (and not 98.7, 98.9 and 99.1). The correct versions 


are provided below. The collision figures with an additional figure in brackets indicate 


where Natural England believe there is an error in the Applicant’s collision numbers (the 


figure in brackets is potentially the correct figure but without the Band Model spreadsheets 


that relate to these calculations Natural England cannot confirm this). See also Natural 


England’s Deadline 9 response to ExA Q F4.1.  


Table 42. NAF2. Variability in density and AR. Maximum Likelihood Flight height. 


AR/density LCL Mean density UCL 


99.4 1 9 12 (19) 


99.5 1 7 10 (16) 


99.6 1 6 8 (13) 


Table 43. NAF3. Variability in density and AR. Maximum Likelihood Flight height. 


AR/density LCL Mean density UCL 


99.4 1 11 23 


99.5 1 9 20 


99.6 1 7 16 


Table 44. NAF 2. Flight height and AR variation, using mean density 


AR/PCH LCL Mean PCH UCL 


99.4 6 9 15 


99.5 5 7 12 


99.6 4 6 10 


Table 45. NAF 3. Flight height and AR variation, using mean density 


AR/PCH LCL Mean PCH UCL 


99.4 7 11 19 







99.5 6 9 16 


99.6 5 7 13 
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ExAQ F4.1 (a): Please explain what conclusions you draw from the results of the 


collision risk model analysis submitted by the Applicant at Deadline 6 [REP6-043] in 


relation to the predicted impacts on the gannet population at Flamborough and Filey 


Coast SPA. Please elaborate on whether the outputs suggest an Adverse Effect on 


Site Integrity as you have done for kittiwake in [REP7-064].     


As highlighted in REP7-064 Natural England consider that the baseline information 
provided by the applicant is insufficient to adequately characterise the Hornsea Three 
Array area and consequently we do not consider it possible to rule out Adverse Effect on 
integrity for Multiple features at multiple sites (including gannet at Flamborough and Filey 
Coast SPA) and significant impacts on species at an EIA level. This position has not 
changed, and will not change unless further data can be provided. 
 
As well as these fundamental concerns regarding the baseline information, Natural 
England have highlighted (throughout the Evidence Plan Process and the Examination) 
several areas of concern with the applicant’s approach to the analysis of their data. 
 
At the Examiner’s request, the applicant has provided collision and displacement figures 
that are more in line with Natural England’s Advice (notably [REP6-043] and [REP4-092]), 
though there are outstanding issues.  
 
Within our REP7-046 response, we sought to provide advice to the ExA in two respects. 
Firstly, to signpost to the outputs within REP6-043 and REP4-092 that related to the 
assessment parameters that most closely align with Natural England’s advice, and 
secondly to provide a worked example to demonstrate the potential ‘difference’ that 
following our advice could make to the conclusion of an assessment. 
 
It has not been and is not Natural England’s intention to provide an alternative set of 
analyses, but simply to highlight and evidence the level of uncertainty surrounding the 
Applicant’s conclusions. 
 
 


ExAQ F4.1 (b) Do you have any observations regarding how the analysis was 


parameterised, as set out in Appendix A of [REP7-032]? 


Appendix A of [REP7-032] provides copies of a selection of Band Model spreadsheets 


populated with the project, turbine and bird parameters and some of the data used for 


CRM for each species (gannet, kittiwake, lesser black-backed gull, great black-backed gull 


and Herring gull). The Applicant has not provided the actual spreadsheets, or all of the 


relevant copies of Band Model worksheets, citing as a reason: “Due to the large number of 


collision risk models required to model the various parameter iterations throughout the 


examination process it is not possible to provide all collision risk models. The models used 


to calculate Natural England’s position (as interpreted by the Applicant) and the Applicant’s 


position are presented in Appendix B. These models present collision risk estimates 


calculated using the mean estimate for all parameters.”  


Natural England cannot find an Appendix B, and therefore has assumed that the Applicant 


is referring to the Band Model information presented in Appendix A of [REP7-032]. 
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Given the large volume of additional analyses and data that the Applicant has submitted to 


the Examination process since submission of their Application, Natural England does not 


consider that the Applicant’s reasoning for not providing all the collision risk modelling data 


is valid. 


Natural England requested this information at Deadline 1 [REP1-211] in order to provide 


transparency and a clear audit trail for the assessments as well as providing data in an 


accessible format for Natural England and the competent authority. Natural England 


reiterated this request in our Deadline 4 submission [REP4-130]. Natural England note that 


the Applicant has waited until Deadline 7 to submit a partial set of the information that 


Natural England had requested.  


At Deadline 4 [REP4-049] and then at Deadline 6 [REP6-043] the Applicant submitted 


tables of collision risk figures that Natural England assumed had been extracted from 


Band Model spreadsheets, but where not all input parameters used in the CRM were 


made available by the Applicant. 


The tables presented in these documents (e.g. Table 3.1 and 3.2 for gannet in [REP7-043] 


also did not present the annual total collisions. The annual number of predicted collisions 


are a key element of the information used to assess impact and Natural England had to 


spend time manually adding the monthly collision values presented by the Applicant to 


derive annual values as a result of the Applicant not presenting this information. Natural 


England had to undertake this work in order to provide the information presented in our 


Deadline 7 response [REP7-078] and to answer the ExA question F2.26. The Band Model 


spreadsheets calculate and present the summed annual collision totals and so had the 


Applicant presented these as requested at the start of the Examination, Natural England 


would not have had to spend a considerable amount of time calculating the figures 


manually. 


Further, in Natural England’s Deadline 7 response [REP7-078] we noted that there were 


errors present in the information that the Applicant has provided in the tables in [REP6-


043] (e.g. in Table 3.15) but without the full set of Band Model spreadsheets, it is not 


possible to see the correct values. 


With regards the Band Model information that the Applicant has now provided in REP7-


032 Natural England do not believe that the copies of the worksheets that the Applicant 


has presented in Appendix A represent the actual spreadsheet outputs from the Band 


Model. Natural England believes that the Applicant has pasted together different elements 


of spreadsheets. 


For example, for Herring gull the following data are presented by the Applicant in Appendix 


A (Figure 1.13): 


 


 







Page 4 of 8 
 


Figure 1. Applicant’s HG figures for Option 2 as presented in Figure 1.13 of [REP7-032] 


 


For example, taking the values for an avoidance rate of 99.4 and summing the 12 monthly 


collision estimates (0, 1.52, 0, 0, 0, 0.55, 0.56, 0, 2.58, 0, 0 and 3.67) gives a total of 8.88 


(9 collisions) and not 5 as indicated in the final total column. The totals are similarly 


incorrect for the other avoidance rates. 


Natural England considers that the Applicant is presenting misleading information by 


implying that they have presented spreadsheet outputs from the Band Model when in fact 


they haven’t. Natural England has run the Band Model using the figures provided by the 


Applicant and the per annum collisions are correct in the Band Spreadsheet (see Figure 2 


below). Therefore the Applicant must have cut and pasted the per annum total column into 


the [REP7-043] from another source 


 


Figure 2. CRM run for Herring gull using parameters provided by Applicant. The per 


annum collisions for AR 99.4, 99.5 and 99.6 should be 9, 7 and 6 respectively and not 5, 4 


and 3 collisions as in the Applicant’s version (see Figure 1 above). 
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Additionally the Band Model spreadsheet data presented as the “Applicant’s position” in 


REP7-032 are even more confusing. The gannet and kittiwake examples have no value in 


the “Input Data” sheet for nocturnal activity factor (Figures 1.16 and 1.18). This “Input 


Data” sheet of the Band Model workbook is where the user should add all the user defined 


input parameters that the model uses to calculate predicted collisions. The “Overall 


Collision Risk” worksheet which the Applicant also presents in REP7-032 (e.g. Figures 


1.17 for gannet and 1.19 for kittiwake) is where the collision risk outputs that the model 


has generated are output. The user should not add any data to this sheet. In the 


Applicant’s example for gannet (Figure 1.17) there is a value in the Nocturnal activity factor 


cell of 3%. This would have required a NAF of 1.12 to have been added to the “Input Data” 


sheet (Figure 1.16). The Applicant has added some text to indicate that a NAF of 1.12 was 


used for the non-breeding season and a NAF of 1.32 for the breeding season (without 


providing any further information about which months are defined for each season). But 


the collision risk figures for each month and the per annum totals in Figure 1.17 are based 


on running the model with a NAF factor of 1.12 equating to 3% daytime activity in all 


months, not two different NAFs that are applicable to different months. The same applies 


to the kittiwake information supplied by the Applicant. Further, in the kittiwake data, the 


input data spreadsheet in Figure 1.18 does not match the output data spreadsheet in 


Figure 1.19 as the avoidance rates reported in the “Overall Collision Risk” page are not the 


same as the avoidance rates specified in the “Input Data” page. Therefore the outputs 


spreadsheet in Figure 1.19 does not represent the results of running the CRM using the 


input values in Figure 1.18 as implied by the Applicant. 


In conclusion, Natural England considers that the information provided by the Applicant in 


Appendix A of REP7-032 is incomplete, inaccurate and misleading. There remains a lack 


of transparency or a clear audit trail regarding the Applicant’s assessment of collision risk 


and this is the reason that Natural England requested that the Applicant publish the Band 


Model spreadsheets that relate to all the collision risk modelling outputs that they have 


presented in their assessments [REP1-211 and REP4-130]. 


ExA Q F.2 : What are your views on the mitigation measures that have been set out 


by the Applicant at Deadline 7 [REP7-030 and REP7-031]?   


Natural England can confirm that raising the minimum blade height is a recognised 


mitigation technique to reduce collision risk. Whilst we acknowledge that the scenarios 


referred to within this document do not represent any kind of commitment from the 


Applicant, we would welcome any changes that would reduce the impacts of this project. 


However, given our stated concerns in relation to baseline data, we do not feel it is 


possible to calculate collision risk with sufficient scientific certainty, and therefore we 


cannot comment as to the adequacy of the options presented in the context of Adverse 


Effect on Site Integrity. 







Page 6 of 8 
 


We note that the applicant has not presented any mitigation options for displacement 


impacts. 


In relation to REP7-031, we would like to highlight that we find the presentation of the 


tables are misleading, with particular reference to the ‘Natural England’ column. 


Whilst there are references to the fact that these figures are based on the Applicant’s 


interpretation of Natural England’s advice in some places within the accompanying text, 


this is not clear from the tables themselves. Reference to REP6-043  within the “Natural 


England” could also make it appear (to those less familiar with the submissions associated 


with this case) that these figures are taken from an Natural England submission, when in 


fact this is a submission made by the applicant. 


For clarity, Natural England do not support the figures presented in the “Natural England” 


column due to our concerns regarding the sufficiency of the Applicant’s baseline data. 


However, we can confirm that the figures presented in these columns align to the 


parameters outlined in our advice.  


Overall, Natural England considers that [REP7-031] Appendix 13 to Deadline 7 submission 


- Collision Risk Estimates for Mitigation Scenarios is confusing and difficult to follow as it 


contains consideration of a raft of different parameter assumptions that are not linked to 


the two mitigation options that the Applicant presents (raising the lower rotor tip height 


from 33.17m to 37.5m relative to mean sea level and raising the lower rotor tip height from 


33.17m to 40m relative to mean sea level). However, comparison of the figures in the 


tables presented in Sections 5 (base case), 6 (37.5m mitigation) and 7 (40m mitigation) 


does indicate the relative effects that raising the lower turbine height would have on 


predicted collision impacts. 


 


ExA Q F4.3: In your Deadline 7 response [REP7-078] you have applied apportioning 


rates from the digital aerial survey data. Please elaborate on why you consider the 


age class data from the digital aerial survey to be more suitable for apportioning 


than the boat-based survey data for each species.   


In our Deadline 7 response we selected apportioning rates derived from the 
digital age class data for two species – Kittiwake and Gannet.  


In our written rep (REP1-211) we requested the applicant supply the digital 
aerial age class data: 


7.16. Hornsea Three have presented an apportioning approach for gannet, kittiwake and puffin 


based on at-sea age class data.  As previously requested (EWG meeting, 23.11.17) a detailed 


breakdown of age class data from boat and digital aerial data sets should be provided in order for 


Natural England to assess suitability of the two data sets and help to establish suitable 


apportioning figures.  


We further state the following in our written rep: 
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7.18. Hornsea Three present age class data derived from both boat based survey data and digital 


aerial survey data.  As a general comment on the suitability of the two data sets it is of note that the 


boat based data is now several years old (2010-2013), and the transects covering the Hornsea 


Three project site were spaced at 6km and resulted in a maximum coverage of 5%. This compares 


to the digital aerial data that were from surveys designed specifically for the Hornsea Three project 


site, cover the 2016 and 2017 breeding seasons, and results in a consistent coverage of 10% of the 


project site.  Furthermore, Natural England note that the digital aerial data collected to inform the 


Hornsea Three application was collected using four cameras, yet only two cameras have been 


analysed, and presented within the application, resulting in half the data collected not being 


presented within the application. Natural England would recommend that that these survey data 


are analysed and presented, this would increase the sample size (and hence decrease uncertainty) 


for age class data derived from these surveys, and result in 20% coverage of the project site.  


The applicant supplied a breakdown of the boat based age class data at Deadline 1, 
REP1-169 and the digital aerial age class data at Deadline 3, REP3-026 (results from 2 
not 4 cameras).  A summary of this data (as calculated by NE) is presented in Table 1 
below. 


For both species, the total sample size is greater in the boat based data set, however as 
the applicant notes, the main limitation to ageing birds from the digital data set is the 
inability to age birds on the water.  This means that while the boat based data set is 
representative of age class ratios for ALL birds (albeit historical data from 2010-2012) the 
digital aerial data is representative of birds in flight   


The key impact for both kittiwakes and gannets is collision risk, and hence birds in flight 
are the sub-sample of interest – indeed it is the same digital aerial data set (birds in flight 
only) that is used to calculate the density parameter in the collision risk modelling. 


Taking this into consideration, along with the reasons stated above (coverage, date range) 
Natural England therefore consider that the digital aerial data set is more appropriate to 
inform apportioning rates.  


We also bring to the Examiners attention that in Annex 2 of our Deadline 4 submission 
(REP4-130) (and repeated this at the ISH5), we highlighted some apparent discrepancies 
in the digital age class data submitted by the applicant (at Deadline 3) and an earlier report 
submitted as part of the EWG process (see below).  


Furthermore we note that age class data from the same digital aerial surveys (but limited to the 


time period April 2016- February 2017) is presented in a report prepared and submitted to NE as 


part of the EWG process (Hi Def 23 May 2017, HC00002-002), On preliminary inspection the data 


presented in REP3-026 appears to differ substantially from the data presented in the Hi Def report, 


in particular the proportion of birds aged is considerably higher in the Hi Def report for both 


gannets and kittiwake. We query why these discrepancies exist and request the applicant submits 


the Hi Def report (23 May 2017) as part of the examination process. 
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Table 1: Summary age class data for boat based and digital aerial survey 


data set – derived from data supplied by the applicant REP1-169 and REP3-


026. 


 


Species Data set Date range Sample 
size 


% aged % adults 


Gannet Boat based – 6km 
transect spacing across 
Hornsea 3 project site 


March – 
Sept1,  2010-
2012 


1477 42.7 46.82  


Gannet Digital aerial surveys, 
2km transect spacing 
across Hornsea project 
site plus 4km buffer 


March – 
Sept3, 2016-
2017 


793 27.9 62.44  


Kittiwake Boat based – 6km 
transect spacing across 
Hornsea 3 project site 


March – 
Sept5,  2010-
2012 


5272 30.7% 75.8  


Kittiwake Digital aerial surveys, 
2km transect spacing 
across Hornsea project 
site 


March – 
Sept6, 2016-
2017 


3696 30% 93.1% 


 


 


 


                                            
1 No data for Sept 2011 & 2012 
2 Presented as 46.5% by the applicant in REP4-049 
3 No data for March 2016 
4 Presented as 63.3% by the applicant in REP4-049 
5 No data for Sept 2011 & 2012 
6 No data for March 2016 
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F6.1 
 
The Examining Authority notes that the 
Southern North Sea SAC was designated 


in February 2019. Please provide 
electronic copies of the citation and 
conservation objectives that were 


submitted as part of the final 
confirmation package for this site as well 


as any condition assessment that may 
have been undertaken.  


 


Citation 


Natural England has 


submitted an electronic 


copy of the Register Entry 


(citation) with our Deadline 


9 response. 


Conservation Objectives 


JNCC has advised Natural 


England that the updated 


conservation advice for this 


site is currently in the 


process of being signed off. 


This is expected 


imminently, and Natural 


England will forward a copy 


as soon as it becomes 


available. 


In lieu of this Natural 


England has submitted an 


electronic copy of the draft 


conservation advice for this 


site. 


Condition Assessment 


JNCC has confirmed that 


there has not yet been a 


condition assessment 


undertaken for this site. 
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Date: 25 March 2019 
Our ref:  HOW3 D9 
Your ref: EN010080 
  


 
Hornsea Project Three Case Team 
Planning Inspectorate 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
BY EMAIL ONLY 
 


 
 Customer Services 
 Hornbeam House 
 Crewe Business Park 
 Electra Way 
 Crewe 
 Cheshire 
 CW1 6GJ 
 


 


Dear Sir or Madam, 
 
 
Planning Act 2008, Ørsted Hornsea Project Three Limited, Proposed Hornsea Project Three 
Offshore Windfarm Order 
 
Natural England has reviewed the Applicant’s submissions at Deadline 7 and overall our advice in 
relation to this project remains unchanged.  
 
As our advice has already been well documented throughout the course of the Examination, we 
have not sought to repeat this, but rather highlight points of clarification and signpost to where more 
detailed comments can be found in response to Examining Authority Written Questions. 
 
As an additional point, we have noted that throughout these more recent submissions, there 
reference to Natural England’s advice being (for example) ‘extreme’ or ‘at the extreme end of the 
spectrum’ and ‘representing a gross overestimate’. 
 
We would like to take this opportunity to state that Natural England’s advice on this project  is in line 
with the requirements of the relevant legislation and consistent with our advice on similar plans or 
projects. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
Emma Brown 
Natural England 
Click here to enter text. 
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1. Natural England’s comments on the Applicants comments on the RIES [REP7-006] 
 
1.1. Natural England has reviewed the Applicant’s submission, and would like to clarify a few 


points raised. 
 


1.2. Introduction 
 
1.2.1 Natural England does not agree with the applicant’s comments that they have taken 


a ‘highly precautionary’ approach to their assessment of impacts to European sites. 
Whilst they may have taken a precautionary approach to establishing their maximum 
design parameters to allow increased flexibility, they have for example screened out 
features of sites based on their impacts alone, without consideration of the in-
combination impacts. 
 


1.2.2  Within the introductory section, the Applicant has criticised Natural England for not 
providing a definitive view on the screening of Likely Significant Effects, or on the 
Risk of Adverse Effect on Integrity. Natural England would like to highlight that we 
have done this where it has been possible to do so. Where Natural England have not 
been able to provide a definitive view on such matters this is due to insufficient 
evidence provided by the Applicant, or because a feature has been screened out of 
further consideration in the RIAA without sufficient evidence and justification. In these 
instances Natural England’s advice has been that there is not sufficient evidence to 
rule out Adverse Effect on Integrity beyond reasonable scientific doubt. 
 


1.2.3 The Applicant also refers to Natural England failing (in their opinion) to deduce ‘any 
evidence in support of its position’. Natural England would highlight that under the 
Habitat’s Regulation’s the onus is on the Applicant to provide evidence and 
justification for their conclusions. Whilst we recognise that the Applicant believes they 
have provided sufficient evidence to support their conclusions, there remains 
uncertainties in relation to the scale of impacts and the likelihood of any proposed 
mitigation removing the potential for an Adverse Effect on Integrity (AEoI). Case Law 
has highlighted the need for certainty beyond reasonable scientific doubt that impacts 
can be adequately mitigated. This is currently not the case here.  
Notwithstanding this point, Natural England considers the advice we have provided to 
be evidence based and consistent with our advice on other projects.  


 
1.3. Natural England note that in paragraph 2.2.2 the Applicant highlights that their Digital Aerial 


survey methodology was presented to and agreed by NE and RSPB at the Expert Working 
Group with specific discussion on precision and coverage. Natural England have not 
disputed this. However, from the small amount of information available during subsequent 
EWGs it appeared that the Applicant were not achieving the level of precision they had 
previously indicated they would. Natural England have made repeated requests throughout 
this examination for the Applicant to provide information on the precision of their monthly 
population estimates but this has not been forthcoming. 
 


1.4. With Reference to the Applicant’s comment on Stage 2 Matrix 6 point b, Natural England 
would reiterate that there is currently no agreed/ legally secure process for identifying the 
potential headroom within consented plans or projects. As such, we do not consider the 
approach the applicant has taken to be Habitat Regulations compliant. 


 
 
 
2. Natural England’s comments on the Applicant’s comments on Interested Parties 


responses at Deadline 6 [REP7-007] 
 
2.1. Natural England has reviewed the comments in REP7-007. We note that we remain in 
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disagreement with the applicant in a number of areas (as reflected in our SoCGs with the 
Applicant, which we believe the Applicant intend to submit at Deadline 8). 
 


2.2. In relation to our benthic concerns, we welcome the Applicant’s clarifications and responses 
to the questions we posed in relation to the Cable Specification and Installation Plan (CSIP) 
and Preliminary PTA. However, in most instances Natural England disagree with the 
Applicant, or do not consider that the Applicant’s response provides sufficient evidence to 
allay our concerns. Consequently, our advice as set out in our Deadline 7 response [REP7-
066, REP7-067, REP7-070, REP7-073] remains unchanged. Natural England’s view in 
relation to European Sites remains that it is not appropriate to rely on post consent surveys 
to inform mitigation decisions where it cannot be demonstrated with certainty beyond 
reasonable scientific doubt that such mitigation would exclude significant impacts. 


 
 


3. Natural England’s comment’s on the Applicant’s written submission of representations 
made at  ISH 7 [REP7-009] 
 
3.1. Natural England has reviewed the Applicant’s submission and our position/advice remain 


unchanged. As we feel our advice has been sufficiently documented throughout this 
examination, we are not proposing to comment on the detail of this submission, but would  
like to clarify a few points that the applicant has raised in our absence regarding discussions 
held outside of formal hearings. 
 


3.1.1 In relation to paragraph 3.1, Natural England would like to highlight that the applicant 
had, prior to the call on 27th February, substantially revised the structure of the 
Benthic Ecology and Marine Processes Statement of Common Ground, providing a 
summary of advice under the broad headings requested by the ExA. Natural 
England’s feedback on this revised format had been that this new structure had lost 
its specificity in relation to designated sites, and that consequently where Natural 
England might be able to agree to some parts of statements for some sites, we would 
have to disagree overall. Both parties agreed that this would not be helpful to the 
ExA. In discussing a way forward, Natural England advised the Applicant that we 
were working on summaries of our advice on each benthic site that we hoped to 
submit at Deadline 7, but that this could slip depending on the amount of time 
required to complete the SoCG. The Applicant felt that this would be helpful in 
informing the structure of the SoCG, and consequently it was mutually agreed during 
discussions with Natural England’s project team including our benthic specialist, that 
Natural England would focus efforts on completing these summaries, with a view to 
submitting the SoCG at a later deadline.. 
 


3.1.2 In relation to paragraph 6.2, Natural England would like to highlight that this list of 
information was previously provided within our Written Representation at Deadline 1, 
and resubmitted at Deadline 4. We are unclear as to why the applicant has been 
unable to provide this information within the examination timeframe. 
 


3.1.3 In relation to paragraph 6.3, Natural England wishes to highlight that we have 
engaged as much as we possibly could, given the current constraints. In recognition 
of the challenges faced by the Hornsea Project Three  we have offered weekly 
meetings with Natural England’s Senior Responsible Officer for their project which is 
an exception and not the norm for the other OWF NSIPs currently in examination 


 
3.1.4 In relation to paragraph 6.4, Natural England notes that the Applicant stated that we 


‘rejected’ a meeting to discuss mitigation. This statement is misleading and 
inaccurate. Natural England’s response to the Applicant’s initial request was that we 
would be unable to provide advice on a quantitative/site specific basis (given our 
position on the baseline dates) and that it would therefore be unlikely that we could 
offer any insight beyond the types of mitigation that could be considered. We 
highlighted that given the Applicant’s consultant’s (NIRAS) experience of other 
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projects which have explored potential mitigation (such as Hornsea 2), we would 
anticipate the Applicant would be fully aware of all of the existing mitigation measures 
and potential for these to be adopted by this protect  
When  the Applicant continued to reiterate their request, Natural England requested 
further details of the proposed meeting and their desired outcomes. Unfortunately the 
Applicant’s response to us was ill-timed, coinciding with  Natural England needing  to 
prioritise our statutory obligations for Deadline 7 and 9 submissions. Therefore we 
have not had the availability to consider this further and respond. However, Natural 
England would stress that we have not rejected the request of a meeting to discuss 
mitigation, and would be happy do so if a clear set of objectives for such a meeting 
can be agreed and if our availability allows. 
 


3.2 As context, Natural England has only a small team of 5 core people (including specialists) 
working on this case . Of these people, several work part time, and all have work 
commitments beyond Hornsea Project Three (including work on other projects in 
Examination). As there are three offshore windfarm NSIP cases in examination at present, 
there is no availability for any additional resource beyond this. As highlighted in our oral 
and written submissions, the number and length of additional documents submitted 
throughout the course of this examination has been vast, and consequently the task of 
responding to each of the statutory deadlines has been particularly challenging, with staff 
regularly working well beyond their contracted hours. Consequently, there has been little or 
no time available to engage in the ‘non-statutory’ elements of the examination, (i.e. 
dialogue with the Applicant). This serves to highlight the importance of making the best use 
of the Evidence Plan Process and Section 42 consultations on the PIER prior to the 
submission of an application. 
 


3.3 In paragraph 6.34 of REP7-009 the Applicant refers to the counterfactual of final population 
size metrics that are derived from the Population Viability Analysis model results. The 
Applicant makes the point that the counterfactual metrics presented in slide 9 of REP7-009 
are all “higher than a number consented in Scotland, where the population of kittiwake is in 
a less favourable condition, and no adverse effect was concluded”. The Applicant further 
states that “there is a lack of a hard threshold for determining effect, as this will not be 
provided by statutory nature conservation bodies”. Natural England note that the reason 
that there is no threshold that can be generically applied to a counterfactual metric for an 
SPA population is that whether a given level of population impact is considered to 
represent an AEoSI is dependent on factors such as the status of the feature at the SPA 
and the specific conservation objectives for that feature at that site. The impacts that that 
relate to the kittiwake feature of FFC SPA should be assessed against the status of, and 
Conservation Objectives for this feature at this site, and not to the status or conservation 
objectives pertaining to kittiwake at Scottish SPAs. Natural England also note that the 
kittiwake feature at FFC SPA is considered to be in unfavourable condition and so it is not 
clear what the Applicant means when they say that the population is in “less favourable 
condition” in Scotland. Further, Natural England do not agree with the values of the 
counterfactual metrics that the Applicant has presented in slide 9 (see Natural England’s 
REP7-078 for information on the counterfactuals for the kittiwake population at FFC SPA 
against different impact scenarios). 


 
 
4. Natural England’s comments on the Applicant’s Outline Landscape Plan [REP7-018] 


 
4.1. Natural England has reviewed this document and provided feedback to the Applicant as 


through our ongoing discussions on our Statement of Common Ground for ‘All other 
Matters’. (We anticipate this SoCG will be provided by the Applicant at Deadline 9) 
 
 


5. Natural England’s comments on the Applicant’s position statement on ornithological 
mitigation options [REP7-030] and Ornithological Mitigation Scenarios [REP7 031] 
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5.1. Natural England has reviewed these documents in response to ExA Question F4.2 
 
 


6. Natural England’s comments on “Ornithological Data Request” [REP7 032] 
 
6.1. Natural England has reviewed this document in response to ExA Question F4.1 
 
 
 


 








 


Register of European offshore marine sites 


 


 


Register entry UK0030395 under Regulation 19 of The Conservation of Offshore 


Marine Habitats and Species Regulations 2017 


 


 


This is the register entry for the European offshore marine site known as Southern North 


Sea in the ‘Southern North Sea’ and ‘Northern North Sea’ Regional Seas. This area has 


been proposed to the European Commission by the Secretary of State for Environment, Food 


and Rural Affairs pursuant to Article 4.1 of the “Habitats Directive” (Council Directive 


92/43/EEC) as eligible for designation as a Special Area of Conservation. The register 


reference number for this European offshore marine site is UK0030395 and a folder, kept 


under this reference as part of this register, contains a map of the European offshore marine 


site and a description, both signed by me, giving the reasons for designation of the site as a 


Special Area of Conservation. As the boundary of this site crosses into English inshore 


waters, there is an additional entry for this site in the Register of European Sites for England 


(UK0030395). 


 


Other details of the European offshore marine site are as follows: 


 


Date submitted to European Commission: 30th January 2017 


Date approved by the European Commission as a Site of Community Importance: 12th 


December 2018 


Date site designated as an SAC: 26th February 2019 


Site centre location1 


 Longitude: 01 47 60 E 


 Latitude: 53 33 04 N 


Area: 3,695,054 ha (Projection: Europe Albers_Equal_Area_Conic2) 


Priority status3: No 


Date of registration as European Offshore Marine Site: 12th December 2017 


 


   


 
                                                 
1 This indicates the approximate centre of the site, calculated in WGS84. 
2 Modified projection suited for mapping the offshore continental shelf. Full details available from Joint Nature 


Conservation Committee OffshoreMPAs@jncc.gov.uk. 
3 Indicates whether the site has been identified under Article 4.2 of the Habitats Directive (Council Directive 


92/43/EEC) as hosting one or more priority natural habitat types or priority species. 







Reasons for recommendation as a Site of Community Importance 


  


 
Area name:   Southern North Sea 


 


Administrative area:  Norfolk/Suffolk/offshore 


 


Component SSSI:  N/A 


 


This area has been recommended as a Site of Community Importance (SCI) because it contains 


habitat types and/or species which are rare or threatened within a European context.  The habitats 


and/or species for which the area has been recommended as an SCI are listed below.  


 


Site description: 


The Southern North Sea SAC is located in the North Sea Management Unit and has been recognised 


as an area with predicted persistent high densities of harbour porpoise (JNCC, 2017). The site 


includes some areas that are more important for the species during the winter, some that are more 


important during the summer and some that are important throughout the year (Heinänen and Skov, 


2015). The site is located to the east of England and it stretches from the central North Sea (north of 


Dogger Bank) to the Straits of Dover in the south, covering an area of 36,951 km2. A mix of habitats, 


such as sandbanks and gravel beds, cover the seabed and water depths range from mean low water to 


75 m, with the majority of the site shallower than 40 m.   
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HEINÄNEN, S and SKOV, H. 2015. The identification of discrete and persistent areas of relatively 


high harbour porpoise density in the wider UK marine area, JNCC Report No. 544, JNCC, 


Peterborough. 


 
JNCC (2017) SAC Selection Assessment: Southern North Sea. January, 2017. Joint Nature 


Conservation Committee, UK. Available from: http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-7243 


 


  


Qualifying interest(s) submitted to the European Commission: 


 


1.   1351: Harbour porpoise (Phocoena phocoena)  


 


• for which this is considered to be one of the best areas in the United Kingdom. 


 


 


 







 







 







For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
______________________________________________________________________



 
 

 

 

 
  

 
 

Harbour Porpoise (Phocoena phocoena) possible 
Special Area of Conservation:  

Southern North Sea 
 

Draft Conservation Objectives and Advice on 
Activities 

 
January 2016 

 

Advice under Regulation 18 of The Offshore Marine Conservation (Natural Habitats, 
etc.) Regulations 2007 (as amended), and Regulation 35(3) of The Conservation of 
Habitats and Species Regulations 2010 (as amended). 

© Colin Speedie/Wave Action 



 
 

 
 

 

Further information 
This document is available as a pdf file on the JNCC website for download if required 
(www.jncc.defra.gov.uk). 
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Marine Species Advice Team 
Joint Nature Conservation Committee 
Inverdee House 
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Summary of Conservation Objectives and Advice on Activities  
 
The Conservation Objectives and Advice on Activities are set out for the Southern North Sea 
possible SAC (pSAC) for the Annex II species harbour porpoise (Phocoena phocoena). The 
site covers both inshore (within 12 nautical miles of coast) and offshore (beyond 12 nautical 
miles of coast) waters where Natural England (NE) and the Joint Nature Conservation 
Committee (JNCC) have respective advisory responsibilities.  
The general objective of achieving or maintaining Favourable Conservation Status (FCS) for 
all species and habitat types listed in Annexes I and II of the Habitats Directive needs to be 
translated into site-level Conservation Objectives. These describe the condition to be 
achieved by species and habitat types within the sites in order for the site to contribute in the 
best possible way to achieving FCS at the national, bio-geographical and European level. 
The Conservation Objectives have been developed for the feature (harbour porpoise) 
throughout the recommended possible SAC network to ensure coherence across the 
network. This is also appropriate for a wide ranging, mobile and continuous population. The 
Advice on Activities is site-specific but based on a broad assessment of the sensitivity of the 
harbour porpoise to man-made pressures at a UK scale. The advice has been developed 
using the best-available scientific information and expert interpretation as at November2015. 
The advice provided here will be subject to change as our knowledge about the site and the 
impacts of human activities improve.  
The site should be managed in a way that ensures that its contribution to the maintenance of 
the harbour porpoise population at FCS is optimised. This may require management of 
human activities occurring in or around the site if they are likely to have an adverse impact 
on the site’s Conservation Objectives either directly or indirectly identified through the 
assessment process. Management of activities that may affect processes on which the 
harbour porpoise is dependent, e.g. recruitment of prey species from supporting habitats, 
cannot be considered at present due to insufficient (often no) evidence linking habitat 
characteristics to prey of the harbour porpoise. There is some information on the prey of 
harbour porpoises, but their prey preferences whilst within the sites are not well known. It 
should be noted that as European Protected Species under Annex IV of the Habitats 
Directive, harbour porpoise are already strictly protected wherever they are in European 
waters. As such several management measures are already in place in the UK. 
To fulfil the Conservation Objectives for the Southern North Sea harbour porpoise site, the 
relevant1 and competent2 authorities should consider human activities within their remit 
which might affect the integrity of the site.  

                                                
1 Relevant authorities are those who are already involved in some form of relevant marine regulatory 
function and would therefore be directly involved in the management of a marine site. 
2 A competent authority is any Minister, government department, public or statutory undertaker, public 
body of any description or person holding a public office. 
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1 Introduction  
1.1 Background 

A potential network of eight sites was identified within UK waters for harbour porpoise 
(Phocoena phocoena). Sites were identified within the UK portions of Management Units 
(MUs) defined for the species (ICES, 2014; IAMMWG, 2015a). The Welsh and Northern 
Ireland Governments, along with Defra on behalf of England and offshore waters, gave 
approval for sites within their areas of jurisdiction to proceed to consultation. The resulting 
five sites are shown in Figure 1. 

 
Figure 1: Possible Special Areas of Conservation for the harbour porpoise, Phocoena phocoena 
identified in Northern Ireland, England, Wales and offshore waters. The MU boundary refers to 
management units North Sea and Celtic and Irish Seas.  
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This advice is for the Southern North Sea site (Figure 2) which is subject to protection under 
the Habitats Directive as transposed by the Conservation of Habitats and Species 
Regulations 20103 and the Offshore Marine Conservation Regulations (Natural Habitats, 
etc.) Regulations 20074 (as amended). The advice is given in fulfilment of the duty of the 
Statutory Nature Conservation Bodies (SNCBs) under the Habitats Regulations to inform 
Relevant and Competent Authorities as to (a) the Conservation Objectives for the site; and 
(b) any activities which may negatively impact the feature [harbour porpoise] for which the 
site is designated. The SNCBs aim to ensure that the Conservation Objectives are up-to-
date, accessible and allow the assessment of the impact of proposed developments against 
them.  
 

2 Responsibilities of Relevant and Competent Authorities 
The Habitats Regulations require Relevant and Competent Authorities to exercise their 
functions so as to secure compliance with the Habitats Directive. Competent Authorities 
must, within their areas of jurisdiction, have regard to both direct and indirect effects on the 
site. This may include consideration of issues outside the boundary of the SAC, if the impact 
of these occurs within the site boundaries. Relevant and Competent Authorities are not 
required to undertake any actions or ameliorate changes in the condition of the site if it is 
shown that the changes result wholly from natural causes.  
The natural variability of harbour porpoise distribution and abundance within sites is likely to 
be large due to the mobility and wide ranging nature of this species. Apparent deterioration 
of harbour porpoise presence at the site must be contextualised in terms of the natural 
variability in abundance and distribution patterns at the population level (i.e. Management 
Unit level). SNCBs will work with Relevant and Competent Authorities and others to agree a 
protocol to guide assessments, and this will require consideration for the population at the 
wider scale MU population.  It is essential that any assessment for the site reflect the natural 
variation of the species, including assessments in the condition of the site.  
 

3  Conservation Objectives for harbour porpoise SACs 
3.1 The role of Conservation Objectives  

Site level Conservation Objectives are a set of specified objectives that must be met to 
ensure that the site contributes to maintaining or achieving Favourable Conservation Status 
(FCS) of the designated site feature(s) at the national and biogeographic level (EC, 2012). 
Conservation Objectives constitute a necessary reference for identifying site-based 
conservation measures and for carrying out Habitat Regulations Assessments of the 
implications of plans or projects. The purpose of the Habitat Regulations Assessment is to 
determine whether a plan or project adversely affects a site’s integrity. The critical 
consideration in relation to site integrity is not the extent or degree of an impact, or whether 
an impact is direct or indirect, but whether the implications of any activities affecting a site, 
either individually or in combination with other plans or projects, affect the site’s ability to 
achieve its conservation objectives and favourable conservation status. 
Harbour porpoise are protected everywhere in European waters under the provisions of 
Annex IV and Article 12 of the Habitats Directive. The harbour porpoise in UK waters is 
considered part of a wider European population and the mobile nature of this species means 
that the concept of a ‘site population’ may not be appropriate for this species. Site based 

                                                
3 http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2010/490/pdfs/uksi_20100490_en.pdf 
4 http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2007/1842/pdfs/uksi_20071842_en.pdf 
 

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2010/490/pdfs/uksi_20100490_en.pdf
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2007/1842/pdfs/uksi_20071842_en.pdf
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conservation measures will complement wider ranging measures that are in place for the 
harbour porpoise.  
 

3.2 Background to Conservation Objectives  

The Conservation Objectives are designed to ensure that the obligations of the Habitats 
Directive can be met. Article 6(2) of the Directive requires that there should be no 
deterioration or significant disturbance of the qualifying species or to the habitats upon which 
they rely. Therefore, the focus of the Conservation Objectives for harbour porpoise sites is 
on addressing pressures that affect site integrity and would include: 

 killing or injuring significant numbers of harbour porpoise (directly or indirectly); 
 preventing their use of significant parts of the site (disturbance / displacement); 
 significantly damaging relevant habitats;  or 
 significantly reducing the prey base. 

 
This Conservation Objectives document includes both a statement of the actual 
Conservation Objectives and supplementary advice with regard their intent and interpretation 
specific to the site. The Objectives have been set taking account of European Commission 
guidance (EC, 2012).  Further guidance on their specific application to certain casework will 
also be provided at a later stage. 
 

3.3  The Southern North Sea pSAC Conservation Objectives 

The Southern North Sea pSAC is the largest of the possible SACs proposed for the 
conservation of harbour porpoise (Figure 2).  The qualifying feature of the site is the Habitats 
Directive Annex II species:  

 harbour porpoise (Phocoena phocoena) 
Seasonal differences in the relative use of the site have been identified based on the 
analyses of Heinänen and Skov (2015) which shows that harbour porpoise occur in elevated 
densities in some parts of the site compared to others during summer and winter (Figure 
2).The seasonality in porpoise distribution should be considered in the assessment of 
impacts and proposed management.  
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Figure 2: The Southern North Sea possible Special Area of Conservation for harbour porpoise 
showing summer and winter areas.  
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The Conservation Objectives for the site are: 
  

To avoid deterioration of the habitats of the harbour porpoise or significant 
disturbance to the harbour porpoise, thus ensuring that the integrity of the site is 
maintained and the site makes an appropriate contribution to maintaining Favourable 
Conservation Status (FCS) for the UK harbour porpoise.  
To ensure for harbour porpoise that, subject to natural change, the following attributes are 
maintained or restored in the long term:  
1. The species is a viable component of the site. 
2. There is no significant disturbance of the species. 
3. The supporting habitats and processes relevant to harbour porpoises and their prey are 
maintained. 

 
These Conservation Objectives are common across all sites proposed for this species to 
ensure coherence across the network (EC, 2012). These Conservation Objectives are based 
on considerations of the ecological requirements of the species within the site, yet their 
interpretation is contextualised in their contribution to maintaining FCS at a wider scale (EC, 
2012). With regard the Southern North Sea site, harbour porpoise need to be maintained 
rather than restored. Maintain implies that, based on our existing understanding, the feature 
is regarded as being in favourable condition and will, subject to natural change, remain in 
this condition after designation.  
 
1. The species is a viable component of the site:  
Harbour porpoises are considered to be a ‘viable component’ of the site if they are able to 
survive and live successfully within it. The Southern North Sea site has been selected 
primarily on the basis of its long-term, preferential use by harbour porpoise in contrast to 
other areas of the North Sea. The implication is that this site provides good foraging habitat 
and it may also be used for breeding and calving. However, because the number of harbour 
porpoise using the site naturally varies, there is not an exact number of animals within the 
site above which the species is viable or below which it will become unviable.  
For that reason, the intent of this objective is to minimise the risk posed by activities within 
the site to the species viability. Activities that kill, injure or significantly disturb harbour 
porpoise have the potential to affect species viability within the site.  
The harbour porpoise is a European Protected Species (EPS) listed on Annex IV of the 
Habitats Directive and as such is protected under Article 12 from deliberate killing (or injury), 
capture and disturbance throughout its range. However, the relevant/competent authorities 
are reminded of these provisions and their application to the site as an integral part of the 
species’ range. The Habitats Directive Article 12 guidance5 proposes the following definition 
of deliberate: “deliberate actions are to be understood as actions by a person who knows, in 

the light of the relevant legislation that applies to the species involved, and the general 
information delivered to the public, that his action will most likely lead to an offence against a 
species, but intends this offence or, if not, consciously accepts the foreseeable results of his 
action”.  
The meaning of ‘deliberately injure’ should be taken from the definition under regulations 
41(1)(a) and 39(1)(a) of the Conservation (Natural Habitats etc.) Regulations 1994 and its 

                                                
5 http://ec.europa.eu/environment/nature/conservation/species/guidance/pdf/guidance_en.pdf 

http://ec.europa.eu/environment/nature/conservation/species/guidance/pdf/guidance_en.pdf
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amendments consolidated in The Conservation of Habitats and Species Regulations 2010 
for England and Wales 
The disturbance under Article 12(1)(b) must be deliberate and not accidental. The definition 
of ‘deliberate disturbance’ is given in 39(1)(b) of Offshore Marine Conservation (Natural 
Habitats, etc.) Regulations 2007 (Offshore Marine Regulations, OMR, as amended in 2009 
and 2010). It is an offence under these Regulations to deliberately disturb EPS in such a 
way as to: a) impair their ability to survive, to breed or reproduce, or to rear or nurture their 
young or b) to affect significantly the local distribution or abundance of that species. Further 
guidance as to the interpretation of and what constitutes ‘deliberate’ and ‘significant 
disturbance’ is given in the JNCC EPS guidance6. These definitions of types of disturbance 
are for the purposes of assessing the need for an EPS licence and apply throughout UK 
waters. 
Bycatch of harbour porpoise in fishing nets is not deliberate but incidental killing. Article 12 
(4) of the Habitats Directive applies and states that Member States ‘shall establish a system 
to monitor the incidental capture and killing of the species listed on Annex IV (all cetaceans). 
In the light of the information gathered, Member States shall take further research or 
conservation measures as required to ensure that incidental capture and killing does not 
have a significant negative impact on the species concerned’. Consideration must be given 
to the effect of bycatch on the conservation status of harbour porpoise at the population 
level. The impacts of bycatch within a site contribute to impacts from bycatch outside the site 
and thus may affect the conservation status of harbour porpoise. Bycatch, therefore, poses a 
risk to the viability of the population and therefore could be deemed to affect the integrity of 
the site. Measures may be needed to minimise the risk of bycatch to porpoises using the 
site.  
 
2. There is no significant disturbance of the species within the site  
Disturbance of harbour porpoise generally, but not exclusively, originates from activities that 
cause underwater noise (section 4). Responses to noise can be physiological and/or 
behavioural. JNCC has produced guidelines to minimise the risk of physical injury to 
cetaceans from various sources of loud, underwater noise7. However, disturbance is a 
behavioural (non-injurious) response to noise and may lead to harbour porpoises being 
displaced from the area affected.  
Within sites, the immediate effects of disturbance are in the loss (usually temporary) of 
habitat available to harbour porpoise.  The Southern North Sea site has been identified on 
the basis of having persistent higher densities of harbour porpoises (Heinänen and Skov 
2015) when compared to other areas of the UK’s North Sea continental shelf which is linked 
to the habitats within the site that likely promote good feeding opportunities. Therefore, 
activities within the site should be managed to ensure access to the site; any disturbance 
should not lead to the exclusion of harbour porpoise from a significant portion of the site for a 
significant period of time. Case Work Advice Guidance in relation to various activities is 
being developed and expands this supplementary advice to define ‘significant portion and 
period’ in the context of impacting site integrity.   
This Conservation Objective aims to ensure that the site contributes, as best it can, to 
maintaining the Favourable Conservation Status of the wider harbour porpoise population. 
As such, how the impacts within the site translate into effects on the North Sea Management 
Unit population are of greatest concern.   
 
 
                                                
6 http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/PDF/consultation_epsGuidanceDisturbance_all.pdf 
7 http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-4273 

http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/PDF/consultation_epsGuidanceDisturbance_all.pdf
http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-4273
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3. The supporting habitats and processes relevant to harbour porpoises and their 
prey are maintained.  

The harbour porpoise is a species that is highly dependent on a year-round proximity to food 
sources and its distribution and condition may strongly reflect the availability and energy 
density of its prey (Brodie 1995 in Santos & Pierce, 2003). The densities of porpoise using 
the site are likely linked to the availability (and density) of prey within this site. Porpoise eat a 
variety of prey including gobies, sandeel, whiting, herring and sprat (which all have spawning 
grounds within the Southern North Sea site). However, the diet of porpoises specifically 
when using the site is unknown. The activity which potentially risks the achievement of this 
CO is commercial fishing; although environmental variability also plays a role in determining 
the status of fish stocks. However, currently there is no evidence to suggest that competition 
for prey species with commercial fisheries is having an impact on the conservation status of 
the harbour porpoise.  
The delineation of the Southern North Sea site is based on the prediction of ‘harbour 
porpoise habitat’ within the North Sea (Heinänen and Skov 2015). Habitat, in this context, 
means the characteristics of the seabed and water column. Peaks in density of harbour 
porpoise in the Southern North Sea site vary seasonally (Figure 2). At the Management Unit 
scale, for both the summer and winter seasons the distribution of harbour porpoise is related 
to water depth and variables within the water column (Heinänen & Skov 2015). Harbour 
porpoise density peaked in stable stratified waters (based on vertical differences in 
temperature) with lower gradients of eddy activity (turbulence); higher densities were also 
found in areas with current speeds of 0.4-0.6m/s. The analysis indicated a preference for 
water depths between 30 and 50m throughout the year. In general, in both seasons, harbour 
porpoise preferred coarser seabed sediments (sand/gravel). How these environmental 
characteristics of the site influence the prey of harbour porpoise or other aspects of their life 
directly (e.g. breeding/calving) is currently unknown. 
 

4 Advice on Activities 
4.1 Purpose of advice 

This section details the advice on human activities specifically occurring within or close to 
the Southern North Sea pSAC that would be expected to impact the site. Initial assessments 
were done at UK scale, with subsequent site level assessment detailing our understanding 
of impacts occurring with potential to affect harbour porpoise when using the site (Section 5 
& 6).  Advice is only given where pressures8 may act at the site level and therefore, may 
require management if the Conservation Objectives are to be met. Wide-spread pressures 
may also act to affect the overall status of harbour porpoise, but such effects are not 
restricted to specific sites. Such pressures are best dealt with through broader measures. 
Alongside and in addition to the identification of the network of harbour porpoise sites, an 
overarching conservation strategy (DETR, 2000) has been in place for harbour porpoise 
since 2000. In light of a recent conservation literature review (IAMMWG et al 2015b), this 
strategy will be reviewed and updated where necessary.  
The advice identifies activities with potential to affect harbour porpoise using the site (site 
level impacts) as well as (where possible) its supporting habitats in UK waters which may 
impact the species’ capacity to maintain FCS. This advice should also be used to help 
identify the extent to which existing activities are, or can be made, consistent with the 
conservation objectives, and thereby focus the attention of Relevant and Competent 
Authorities and surveillance programmes to areas that may need management measures. 

                                                
8 See Annex A for definition of key terms 
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This draft advice on activities will be updated and supplemented through further discussions 
with the Relevant and Competent Authorities and any advisory groups formed for the site. 
 

4.2 Background 

In compiling this advice on activities, the SNCBs have considered the pressures that may be 
caused by human activities and the sensitivity of the qualifying feature, harbour porpoise, to 
those pressures. The advice is generated through a broad grading of sensitivity and 
exposure of the harbour porpoise to pressures associated with activities in order to gain an 
understanding of how vulnerable the species is to each activity at a UK level.  The activities 
and their associated pressures to which the harbour porpoise is deemed vulnerable at UK 
level are then considered at site level in order to inform possible management needs 
necessary for the site to meet the conservation objectives. Annex A details the approach 
taken to identify the significant impacts on harbour porpoise from pressures, and the relative 
sensitivity and current exposure of harbour porpoise to those pressures at a UK wide scale. 
This document is guidance only and activities and their management will be considered in 
the context of Habitats Regulations Assessments/Appropriate Assessment and where 
applicable through other environmental  assessment processes (e.g. EIA).   
   

5 Activity assessments at UK scale 
The assessments have been carried out using all available evidence as of November 2015. 
As further information becomes available, assessments may be subject to alteration in line 
with the new evidence to support the change, and further improving the understanding of the 
vulnerability of harbour porpoise to activities occurring in UK waters. This advice is made 
without prejudice to any assessment that may be required for specific proposals to be 
considered by a Relevant Authority. The level of any impact will depend on the location, 
timing and intensity of the relevant activity. This advice is provided to assist and focus the 
Relevant Authorities in their consideration of the management of these activities.  
The harbour porpoise is a wide-ranging species and occurs throughout the UK Continental 
Shelf area (JNCC, 2013). It does occur in deeper waters but in very low densities, and 
perhaps only seasonally. As a predominantly shelf species, it is exposed to a wide range of 
pressures, that are both ubiquitous (e.g. pollution) and patchy (e.g. bycatch) in nature, and 
the list of anthropogenic activities leading to these pressures is long. Based on current 
available information, the activities with the most notable impact on UK harbour porpoise are 
shown in Table 1. 
The definitions of the pressures as applied within harbour porpoise SAC advice can be found 
in Annex B 
Activities which currently pose a low risk to porpoises at the UK level (Annex A, Table A2) 
have not been considered in this advice. The exposure to the pressures associated with 
these activities is currently very limited and poses no significant threat to the maintenance of 
harbour porpoise FCS.  Non-anthropogenic impacts are also not considered, such as attack 
and predation from other marine mammal species, that have the potential to impact harbour 
porpoise populations.  
The full list of assessed activities and key references can be found in Annex A, Table A3.  
Updates to the assessments will occur as more evidence becomes available.  
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Table 1: Key activities and the relative risk of impacts on harbour porpoise throughout UK waters. 
Those pressures ranked ‘high’ are known to have the greatest impact relative to other pressures on 
the population of UK harbour porpoises. 

Activities Pressures Impacts Current 
relative level 
of impact  

Commercial fisheries with 
bycatch of harbour porpoise 
(predominantly static nets) 

Removal of 
non-target 
species 

 Mortality through 
entanglement/bycatch 

High 

Discharge/run-off from land-
fill, terrestrial and offshore 
industries 

Contaminants  Affects on water and prey 
quality 

 Bioaccumulation through 
contaminated prey ingestion 

 Health issues (e.g. on 
reproduction) 

High 

Shipping, drilling, dredging 
and disposal, aggregate 
extraction, pile driving, 
acoustic surveys, 
underwater explosion, 
military activity, acoustic 
deterrent devices and 
recreational boating activity 

Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 

 Mortality 
 Internal injury 
 Disturbance leading to 

physical and acoustic 
behavioural changes 
(potentially impacting 
foraging, navigation, 
breeding, socialising) 

Medium 

Shipping, recreational 
boating, tidal energy 
installations 

Death or injury 
by collision 

 Mortality 
 Injury 

Medium/Low 

Commercial fisheries 
(reduction in prey resources) 

Removal of 
target species 

 Reduction in food availability 
 Increased competition from 

other species 
 Displacement from natural 

range 

Medium  

 
Removal of non-target species (harbour porpoise bycatch) 
Bycatch of harbour porpoise in fishing gear is one of the most significant anthropogenic 
pressures impacting on the population. The relevant commercial fisheries with harbour 
porpoise bycatch are certain bottom set nets. The areas where bycatch is of greatest 
concern is off southwest England and the southern North Sea. Mitigation of bycatch through 
the use of acoustic deterrent devices (‘pingers’) is required under EU Regulation 812/20049 
on setnet vessels of 12m or over. However, smaller set net vessels (<12m) comprise the 
majority of the fleet and are the major source of harbour porpoise bycatch in UK waters. 
Where the bycatch/risk of bycatch within porpoise SACs threatens the sites’ integrity, 
mitigation maybe required.   
 
Contaminants 
The latest evidence (Law et al 1992-2005 & 2009; Law et al 2008; ASCOBANS, 2011; 
Murphy et al 2015) shows that there is still a significant pollution issue for at least some 
cetacean species in European waters, which includes harbour porpoise and organochlorines 
(e.g. Polychlorinated biphenyls [PCBs]). Monitoring and investigation will continue to be 
important, and research in this field should not remain focused on ‘old’ compounds and 

                                                
9 http://eur-lex.europa.eu/LexUriServ/LexUriServ.do?uri=OJ:L:2004:150:0012:0031:EN:PDF 
 

http://eur-lex.europa.eu/LexUriServ/LexUriServ.do?uri=OJ:L:2004:150:0012:0031:EN:PDF
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contaminants. Careful consideration is required to ensure we also monitor historical 
contaminant impacts as well as any current or emerging issues.  
 
Anthropogenic underwater sound 
Harbour porpoise use sound for foraging, navigation, social activities and predator detection. 
Changes in underwater noise therefore have the potential to interrupt these behaviours. The 
peak frequency of echolocation pulses produced by harbour porpoise is 120–130 kHz, 
corresponding to their peak hearing sensitivity although hearing occurs throughout the range 
of ~1 and 180 kHz (Southall et al 2007). A range of activities emit sound that falls within the 
hearing sensitivities of porpoise, including shipping, pile driving, Acoustic Deterrent Devices 
and military activities. The exact frequency, intensity and longevity of the sound will 
determine the response. The impact on the porpoise is also mediated through individual 
behaviour, and perhaps quality of its immediate habitat, at the time of exposure.  
 
Death or injury by collision  
Post-mortem evidence indicates that few collisions between harbour porpoise and vessels 
occur and is not a significant pressure for this species.  
Research surrounding wet renewables shows potential risk of harbour porpoise collision with 
sub-marine turbines, although there is no evidence of such collisions to date.  
 
Removal of target species (harbour porpoise prey) 
Porpoise diet within UK waters includes a wide variety of fish and they will generally focus on 
the most abundant local species (De Pierrepont et al 2005; Camphuysen et al 2006). The 
predominant prey type in general appears to be whiting, gobies and sandeel, although 
shoaling fish such as mackerel and herring are also taken. In the north-east Atlantic, a long 
term shift from predation on clupeid fish (mainly herring) to predation on sandeels and 
gadoid fish, possibly related to the decline in herring stocks since the mid-1960s has been 
observed. Porpoise diets overlap extensively with diets of other piscivorous marine predators 
(notably seals) and many of the main prey species are also taken by commercial fisheries, 
although porpoises tend to take smaller fish than those targeted by fisheries (Santos and 
Pierce 2003).  
 

6 Site specific considerations: Southern North Sea pSAC 
6.1 Sensitivity of harbour porpoise to existing activities within or impacting on the 

site  

The Southern North Sea site spans territorial and offshore waters and covers a large 
geographical area. A summary of the site can be found in the Selection Assessment 
Document10. Precise information on many activities within the boundary is not currently 
available due to lack of targeted data collection to date. Assessing exposure carries certain 
assumptions about the spatial extent, frequency and intensity of the pressures associated 
with marine activities. Therefore site based exposure and resulting current level of impact 
has not been assessed at this stage.   

                                                
10 SAC Selection Assessment Document: 

 http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/pdf/SouthernNorthSeaSelectionAssessmentDocument.pdf 

http://jncc.defra.gov.uk/pdf/SouthernNorthSeaSelectionAssessmentDocument.pdf
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Table 2 is an overview of activities occurring within or in proximity to the Southern North Sea 
site to which the harbour porpoise has a current level of impact risk of High or Medium at UK 
level (Table 1) and therefore may require further consideration concerning options for 
management. This was derived from spatial data as GIS layers and a review of the literature, 
and includes all available data at time of writing.  
Management measures are the responsibility of the relevant regulatory bodies, which 
consider the SNCBs’ advice and hold appropriate discussions with the sector concerned, but 
the scale and type of mitigation is decided by the Regulators. Where consent is required and 
the activity (if considered a plan or a project) is likely to significantly affect a European 
Marine site, Article 6(3) of the Habitats Directive requires that an Appropriate Assessment is 
carried out. Assessments under Article 6(3) of the Directive are often referred to in the UK as 
“Habitat Regulations Assessments” (HRA). The HRA is a case-specific assessment made in 
view of the Conservation Objectives for the affected site. Each HRA requires case-specific, 
unbiased advice from the SNCB but is the responsibility of the regulatory body concerned.  
In 2012 the UK Government adopted a revised approach to the management of fishing 
activities within European marine sites (EMS) in England. The revised approach is designed 
to ensure the consistency of the management of fishing activities with Article 6 of the 
Habitats Directive.  Risk based prioritisation of managing the fishing activities of UK and non 
UK vessels has been applied to relevant European marine site features and sub features  
within the UK 12nm territorial limit. For EMS outside of 12nm, or sites outside 6nm where 
there are access rights for other Member States, management measures designed to ensure 
adequate protection are to be proposed to and agreed by the European Commission in 
accordance with the Common Fisheries Policy (CFP). 
 
Table 2: Activities occurring within/near to the Southern North Sea site to which the harbour porpoise 
is considered sensitive.  

Activities Pressure Comment on current 
level of activity  

Management considerations 

Commercial 
fisheries (with 
harbour 
porpoise 
bycatch) 

Removal of 
non-target 
(bycatch) 
species 

UK registered vessels 
>12m: Negligible effort 
of Vessel Monitoring 
System (VMS) 
registered vessels using 
static net gears within 
the site11 

UK registered vessels 
<12m: current exposure 
is unknown 

EU registered vessels: 
higher effort of static net 
setting than UK vessels 
with two concentrated 
areas.  Effort in the 
south east appears to 
have increased between 
2009 and 2013.  

Where management measures are 
required, the development of these 
would be undertaken via discussion 
with fishing interests and fishery 
managers and informed by any 
detailed information about fishing 
activity that can be made available. 
Detailed measures, if required, will be 
developed by the relevant regulator 
(European 
Commission/MMO/IFCA/Defra) 
 
The use of pingers as a mitigation 
measure is required on static nets 
deployed by vessels >12m in length in 
specified areas through EU 
Regulation 812/2004. Through 
derogation, this part of the UK fleet 
currently utilise the DDD.  
 
Because bycatch most often occurs in 
bottom set nets deployed from 
vessels <12m, and the use of pingers 

                                                
11 The fisheries data are aggregated VMS data collected between 2006 and 2013. 
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is not mandatory under Regulation 
812/2004, one option for 
management could be to extend the 
pinger requirement to further vessels. 
The risk of bycatch from this sector in 
the context of the Conservation 
objectives of the site will need to be  
established . Such a requirement may 
have a seasonal component. 
However, further work is needed to 
understand the scale of disturbance 
that would be caused by wide-spread 
deployment of the different types of 
pinger.   

Discharge/run-
off from land-fill, 
terrestrial/ 
offshore 
industries 

Contaminants Current exposure 
within/near the site is 
unknown  

This pressure cannot be managed 
effectively at the site level. Most of the 
relevant pollutants have been 
effectively phased out of use by 
action under the OSPAR Convention 
and, more recently, the EU (e.g. 
PCBs). However, their chemical 
stability will lead to them remaining in 
the marine environment for some time 
and, consequently, human activities 
such as dredging may cause the re-
release of these chemicals into the 
environment or introduce other 
contaminants of which the impacts 
are poorly known.  

Any novel sources of potential 
contamination associated with a new 
plan or project may be assessed 
under HRA. It is recognised that 
further efforts to limit or eliminate PCB 
discharges to the marine environment 
may still be needed.  

Shipping Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 

Several large ports 
along the East coast of 
England resulting in 
large vessel shipping 
routes throughout the 
site.   

The underwater sounds created by 
large ships are unlikely to cause 
physical trauma, but could make 
preferred habitats less attractive as a 
result of disturbance (habitat 
displacement, area avoidance).  
However, additional management is 
unlikely to be required given current 
levels within the site and elevated 
densities of porpoises in this area. 

Oil and gas 
drilling 

Areas licensed for oil 
and gas extraction in the 
northern and central 
parts of the site 

This is a highly regulated industry. 
Existing and inactive (exploratory and 
dry) wells and oil and gas licensed 
blocks occur within the suite of 
proposed sites and any future 
applications would be subject to an 
HRA.  

Dredging and 
disposal 

Capital dredging and 
disposal sites in the 
southern portion of the 

Dredging and disposal can cause 
disturbance leading to physical and 
acoustic behavioural changes. 

file:///C:/Users/lindis%20bergland/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.Outlook/8RWT203W/%20Additional
file:///C:/Users/lindis%20bergland/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.Outlook/8RWT203W/%20Additional
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site However, the risk is considered 
relatively low and additional 
management is unlikely to be required 

Aggregate 
extraction 

Extensive existing 
licensed and active 
areas within the site 

Aggregate extraction can cause 
disturbance leading to physical and 
acoustic behavioural changes. 
However, the risk is considered 
relatively low and additional 
management is unlikely to be required 

Pile driving Current and licensed 
areas for offshore wind, 
including construction 
and maintenance 
phases within the site  

A European Protected Species (EPS) 
licence is already required for any 
construction activity which carries the 
risk of significant disturbance or injury 
As a minimum, developers are 
required to follow the ‘Statutory 
Nature Conservation Agency protocol 
for minimising the risk of injury to 
marine mammals from piling noise’. 
(https://www.gov.uk/government/uplo
ads/system/uploads/attachment_data/
file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf). 
 
A Habitats Regulations Assessment 
(HRA) will be considered for all new 
developments (coastal and marine) 
using pile driving within the site or 
within 26km (see Dahne et al 2013; 
Tougaard et al 2014) of site 
boundaries. If additional mitigation (to 
that required under EPS licence) is 
required, planning and management 
of pile driving activities may be 
needed within the site to ensure the 
Conservation Objectives are met. 
There is potential for a reduction or 
limitation of the 
disturbance/displacement effects by 
varying the schedule of piling, 
particularly if several developments 
are constructing at the same time and 
pile driving footprints do not overlap 
(i.e maximising area from which 
porpoise are excluded). Limited 
spatio-temporal restrictions may be 
needed.  

Other examples of mitigation include 
the use of sound dampers, methods 
that create a barrier to sound transfer 
(e.g. bubble curtains) and, more 
effectively, the use of alternative 
foundation types (e.g. gravity 
foundations, suction cups, floating 
turbines, drilling). Scheduling of 
activities may minimise cumulative 
exclusion from areas.   

Acoustic 
(including 

Seismic exploration Some geophysical surveys within 5km 
of site boundary may require consent 

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50006/jncc-pprotocol.pdf
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seismic) 
surveys 

activity occurs in the site and be subject to HRA. 

Seismic surveys are likely to require 
an EPS licence which may specify 
conditions. As a minimum, it is 
expected that developers will adhere 
to the JNCC Guidelines for minimising 
the risk of injury and disturbance to 
marine mammals from seismic 
surveys (updated August 2010; 
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploa
ds/system/uploads/attachment_data/fi
le/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf) 

Recreational 
boating activity 

Royal Yachting 
Association (RYA) 
cruising routes across 
the extent of the site, 
focussed along the 
coast 

Adherence to wildlife codes of 
conduct is already advocated (e.g the 
WiSe scheme 
http://www.wisescheme.org  ). No 
further management measures are 
likely to be required. 

Acoustic 
deterrent/ 
mitigation 
devices 

Unknown, no consistent 
areas of usage but 
maybe used as a 
mitigation tool during 
pile driving. 

See pile driving.  

Pinger devices 31 UK registered >12m 
setnet boats of which 4 
use pingers in the area 
of the site.  Use in North 
Sea on vessels under 
12m is unknown but 
likely low.  

See ‘Fisheries (commercial and 
recreational) with harbour porpoise 
bycatch’ 

The use of pingers is low/not needed 
in the site. 

Shipping Death or injury 
by collision 

Several large ports 
along the East coast of 
England resulting in 
busy shipping routes 
throughout the site, with 
the highest level of 
activity in the south.   

Post mortem investigations of harbour 
porpoise deaths have revealed death 
caused by trauma (potentially linked 
with vessel strikes) is not currently 
considered a significant risk and no 
additional management is therefore 
required.  

Recreational 
boating activity 

RYA cruising routes 
cross the site, most are 
coastal 

See ‘Shipping’ (with death or injury by 
collision).  
 
Boats conducting recreational activity 
should adhere to wildlife codes of 
conduct (e.g the WiSe scheme 
http://www.wisescheme.org/). 
 
 

Commercial 
fisheries 

Removal of 
target (prey) 
species 

Fisheries targeting prey 
species such as whiting, 
herring, mackerel, 
sandeel and sprat 
throughout their ranges 
in the North Sea, fished 
by UK and EU fisheries.  

Commercial species are managed at 
the larger scale through the CFP.  
.  

https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
https://www.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file/50005/jncc-seismic-guide.pdf
http://www.wisescheme.org/
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6.2 Limitations of the evidence 

It is important to note that the information used to catalogue activities occurring within the 
site is not complete. The available data are drawn from existing monitoring programmes 
(e.g. the UK’s bycatch of protected species monitoring and other European datasets linked 
to VMS monitoring of fishing vessels) but these have limitations including availability and 
accessibility at the time of preparing this advice. Caveats with how the data have been 
collected also need to be understood in order to correctly interpret the information. This can 
result in the use of expert judgement where sufficient evidence is lacking, but risk is implied. 
Below are some points to consider alongside the above table in order to ensure the 
information is not taken out of context:  

 Data availability 
o Globally, the marine environment is generally far behind the evidence levels of 

that on land, particularly in offshore areas, mainly due to scale and cost. 
o Sensitivities surround data that has been gathered by industry, and some data 

are not available for use for advice and management purposes. Often these data 
become available eventually, but not in time to inform management decisions.  
 

 Fishing: Limitations of fishing Vessel Monitoring System (VMS) data 
o VMS positional data are transmitted at approximately 2 hour intervals. There is 

no information transmitted regarding precise vessel activity, therefore 
assumptions on its activity are often made using the location of the vessel and its 
speed profile. 

o Fishing vessels under 12m, (and until 2013, vessels under 15m long) are not 
required to use the VMS, and therefore VMS data tells us nothing regarding the 
activity of this segment of the fleet. However, relevant data can be obtained from 
Association of Inshore Fisheries and Conservation (IFCAs) and will be used to 
develop more detailed guidance to assist with identification of any management 
measures.    

 
 Contaminants 

o Although use of many substances that have contaminated the environment is 
now illegal, re-suspension or reintroduction of pollutants that were used 
historically occurs. It is also difficult to identify sources of contamination when 
dealing with highly mobile species.    
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8 Annex A: Assessment process to establish the significant 
threats to UK harbour porpoise populations 

The sensitivity and vulnerability of harbour porpoise was assessed at UK level against the 
pressure themes identified by OSPAR’s Intersessional Correspondence Group on 
Coordination of Biodiversity Assessment and Monitoring (ICG-COBAM)12 which have been 
adapted slightly in order to suit the application of a highly mobile species. See Annex B for 
the definitions of pressures as used for the harbour porpoise assessments. 
 
Definition of key terms 

Term Definition 
Pressure theme  A group of like-pressures defined by ICG-COBAM 
Sensitivity A measure of tolerance (or intolerance) to changes in environmental conditions 

Vulnerability Vulnerability is a measure of the degree of exposure of a receptor to a pressure to 
which it is sensitive. 

Pressure 
The mechanism through which an activity has an effect on any part of the 
ecosystem’. The nature of the pressure is determined by activity type, intensity 
and distribution. 

Impact The effects (or consequences) of a pressure on a component. 
Impact Risk The current  risk of impact 

Exposure The action of a pressure on a receptor, with regard to the extent, magnitude and 
duration of the pressure. 

Activity Human social or economic action or endeavours that may create pressures on the 
marine environment. 

Source: jncc.defra.gov.uk/page-6515 

 
Determining the level of impact risk of harbour porpoise to an activity 

 
Sensitivity  
Harbour porpoises were assessed as sensitive to a pressure when viability of an individual 
(including physiological stress, reduced fecundity, reduced growth) would be negatively 
affected and recovery did not take place rapidly (within weeks). The assessment 
incorporated expert judgement where required and adopted a single threshold to 
differentiate only between ‘sensitive’ and ‘not sensitive’.  The pressures that harbour 
porpoise are deemed sensitive to are listed in Table A1.  
  

                                                
12 OSPAR 20011: https://ospar.basecamphq.com/projects/6526112-icg-cobam/log 

Feature 
(Harbour porpoise) 

Current 
level of 

impact risk Exposure 
to activity 

Sensitivity 
to activity 

https://ospar.basecamphq.com/projects/6526112-icg-cobam/log
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Table A1: Pressures to which harbour porpoise may be sensitive.  

Pressure Theme Pressures Direct or Indirect  
impact 

Pollution and other 
chemical changes 

Contamination  Indirect  – prey and 
habitat 

Enrichment Indirect - habitat 

 
Other physical 
pressures 
 

Litter Direct  
Anthropogenic underwater sound  Direct 
Barrier to species movement Direct 
Death or injury by collision Direct 

 
Biological pressures 
 

Introduction of microbial pathogens Direct 
Removal of target species Direct 
Removal of non-target species Direct 

 
Exposure  
The list of pressures to which harbour porpoise is sensitive was combined with evidence of 
general exposure to these pressures in UK waters to get an understanding of the current 
level of impact risk; it combined expert knowledge on the overlap in spatial and temporal 
distributions of activities contributing towards a pressure and harbour porpoise densities, 
with direct evidence of impact as reported in the literature and from the UK Cetacean 
Strandings Investigation Programme13.  
 
Current level of impact risk 
Caution was applied throughout the assessment process where there was a lack of direct 
evidence of exposure to an activity; a pressure to which a species was sensitive, was 
assumed to overlap with that species unless a case could be made to the contrary. In this 
sense, lack of direct evidence of exposure does not imply the species is not currently at risk. 
The current level of impact risk of harbour porpoise has not been assessed on a site basis 
due to uncertainties in exposure, driven by incomplete evidence to support the assessment 
at the site scale. The following level of impact scores were chosen to represent harbour 
porpoise vulnerability to activities within UK waters:  

Scores Criteria for overlap in space & time 
between pressure & species Evidence of impact 

Low  None or limited No direct evidence in UK waters 

Medium Some Some evidence of an impact occurring in UK waters 

High Widespread Good evidence of a significant impact 

 
The evidence used to assess the current level of impact is summarised in Table A3 and 
subsequent reference list. 
Activities with a level of impact risk of ‘low’ have not been considered in the site 
assessments unless there is evidence to support a significant vulnerability despite the 
criteria described in the table above. This assessment, although inclusive of expert 
judgement in order to arrive at the assessment outcomes at UK level, provide a base from 
which to apply weighting to site based sensitivity assessments, using all available activity 
data.   

                                                
13 UK Cetacean Strandings Investigation Programme: http://ukstrandings.org/ 

http://ukstrandings.org/
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Table A2: Full assessment of level of impact of activities on harbour porpoise in UK waters. 

Activities Pressures Impacts 
Current 
level of 
impact 
risk  

Commercial fisheries with 
bycatch (predominantly 
static nets) 

Removal of non-
target species 

 Mortality through 
entanglement/bycatch High 

Discharge/run-off from land-
fill, terrestrial and offshore 
industries 

Contaminants 

 Affects on water and prey quality 
 bioaccumulation through 

contaminated prey ingestion 
 health issues (e.g. on 

reproduction) 

High 

Noise from shipping, drilling, 
dredging and disposal, 
aggregate extraction, pile 
driving, acoustic surveys, 
underwater explosion, 
military activity, acoustic 
deterrent devices and 
recreational boating activity 

Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 

 Mortality 
 Internal injury 
 disturbance leading to physical 

and acoustic behavioural changes 
(potentially impacting foraging, 
navigation, breeding, socialising) 

Medium 

Shipping, recreational 
boating, renewable energy 
installations 

Death or injury 
by collision 

 Mortality 
 Injury 

Medium/
Low 

Commercial fisheries, 
bycatch 

Removal of 
target species 

 Reduction in food availability 
 increased competition from other 

species 
 displacement from natural range 

Medium 

Agriculture, aquaculture, 
sewage 

Nutrient 
enrichment 

 Affects on water quality 
 increased risk of algal blooms 

 may present health issues 
Low 

Agriculture, aquaculture, 
sewage 

Organic 
enrichment 

 Affects on water quality 
 increased risk of algal blooms 

may present health issues 
Low 

Waste disposal - 
navigational dredging 
(capital, maintenance) 

Physical change 
(to another 
seabed type) 

 Changes in availability of prey 
species Low 

Bridges, tunnels, dams, 
installations, presence of 
vessels (shipping, 
recreation) 

Water flow (tidal 
current) 
changes - local 

 Changes in location of prey 
species 
Displacement of harbour porpoise 

Low 

Terrestrial and at-sea 
‘disposal’ Litter  Mortality through entanglement 

Ingestion Low 

Bridges, tunnels, dams, 
installations, presence of 
vessels (shipping, 
recreation) 

Barrier to 
species 
movement 

 Habitat inaccessible  
potential physiological effects Low 

Sewage 
Introduction of 
microbial 
pathogens 

 Increased risk of disease Low 
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Table A3: Evidence used to assess exposure to each pressure to which harbour porpoise is 
considered sensitive.  
Example activities linked to each pressure are listed.  

Key activities 
linked to 
pressures 

Pressures Evidence 

Key references 
 

Sp
at

ia
l o

ve
rla

p 
(s

pe
ci

es
 &

 
pr

es
su

re
) 

Po
st

-m
or

te
m

 
ex

am
in

at
io

n 

Discharge/run-off 
from land-fill, 
terrestrial and 
offshore industries 

Contaminants   
Jepson et al 2005; Deaville & Jepson, 2011; 
ICES, 2015a; Van De Vijver et al 2003; Law et al 
2012; Pierce et al 2008; Murphy et al 2015. 

Agriculture, 
aquaculture, 
sewage 

Nutrient 
enrichment 

 
  Craig et al 2013 

Agriculture, 
aquaculture’ 
sewage 

Organic 
enrichment   Craig et al 2013 

Terrestrial and at-
sea ‘disposal’ Litter 

 
 

 
 

Deaville and Jepson, 2011 

Marine renewable 
energy 

Electromagnetic 
changes   WGMME, 2012, ICES 2015a 

Shipping, drilling, 
dredging, pile 
driving, military 
sonar, seismic 
surveys 

Anthropogenic 
underwater 
sound 

  
Deaville & Jepson, 2011; Stone & Tasker, 2006; 
Stone, 2015; Jepson et al 2005; Fernandez et al 
2005; Würsig & Richardson, 2009; WGMME, 
2012.  

Bridges, tunnels, 
dams, installations 

Barrier to 
species 
movement 

  WGMME., 2012; ICES 2015a 
 

Shipping, 
recreational 
boating, renewable 
energy devices 

Death or injury 
by collision 

 
 

 
 

Deaville & Jepson, 2011; Dolman et al 2006; 
ICES 2015a 

Sewage 
Introduction of 
microbial 
pathogens 

  
Harvell et al 1999; Gulland and Hall, 2007; Van 
Bressem et al 2009 

Commercial 
fisheries 

Removal of 
target species   

Simmonds and Isaac, 2007; OSPAR QSR 2010;  
MacLeod et al 2007a, b; Thompson et al 2007; 
Santos and Pierce, 2003; Pierce et al 2007; 
ICES 2015a 

Commercial 
fisheries with by-
catch 

Removal of non-
target species 

 
 

 
 

Deaville and Jepson, 2011; Morizur et al 1999; 
Read et al 2006; Northridge, S. and Kingston, 
A. 2010; Northridge et al 2013; ICES 2015b 
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9 Annex B: Definitions of Pressures as applied within harbour 
porpoise SAC Advice on Activities 

 

Pressures Definition in the context of harbour porpoise advice 

Removal of non-target species The removal of species not targeted by the fishery; in this 
case the bycatch (and probable mortality) of harbour 
porpoise 

Contaminants Introduced material capable of contaminating harbour 
porpoise, prey or habitat important to harbour porpoise, 
with a negative impact directly or indirectly on porpoises 

Anthropogenic underwater sound Introduced noise in a frequency with the potential to cause 
injury or displace harbour porpoise from their natural range 

Death or injury by collision Introduction of physical objects; mobile or immobile, that 
may collide with or result in potential collision of harbour 
porpoise resulting in injury or mortality 

Removal of target species Removal of harbour porpoise prey, resulting in increased 
competition amongst porpoise and other species, and/or 
displacement from their natural range 
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